The Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
Superannuation) (Amendment) Act, 1997

Act 19 of 1997

Keyword(s):
Public Employment, Retirement, Age of Retirement

Amendment appended: 26 of 1998, 4 of 2014

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




THE ANDHRA PRADESH PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT
* (REGULATION OF AGE OF SUPERANNUATION)
- (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997.

ACT No. 19 of 1997*
[i8th August, 1997}

An Act further to amend The Andhra Pradesh
Public Employment (Regulation of age
of Superannuation) Act, 1984.

Be it enacted by the Legislative
Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh
in Forty-eighth Year of the Republic of
Indiasas follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Short title
Andhra .Pradesh Public Employment (Regu- and com-
lation of Age of Superannuatlon) (Amend— mencement .

" ment) Act, 1997.

*Received the assent of the Governor on j4th August,1997.
For Statement of the Objects and Reasons. Please_ see™ the
A.P. Gazette Part -IV-A Extraordmary dated 191:!1 March,

¢ 1997 at p-3. ) ) ’ ’ :

193



Amendment.

194

(2) It shall come irito force at once:

*

L]

2. In the BAndhra Pradesh Public

of -Secti;ﬁn 3, Employment (Regulation of Age of Super-

JAct 23 of

1984,

annuwation) Act, 1984, in .section . 3,--
after sub-section(3), the following sub-
section shall be added at the end, namely:-

"(4) Notm.thstand:.ng anyth:.ng con—
tained in this section, an employee in
the = workcharged establishment of . the
Government, who becomes aregular: Govern-
ment employee by -whatéver means of crders
iSsued- ‘by Government from time to time
shall not be -treated as workman for
purposes -of this Act and shall be.regarded-
as - holder of a Civil post within - the

meaning of article 311 of the CDnstltutlon

_of India and accordingly, he shall retire
from service,-

(a) on attaining the age of fifty
eight years in case, on becoming as a
regular Government employee, he belongs
to superior ‘service; and

(b) ‘on attaining the age of s:i.xty
years in case, on becom.ng as a regular
Government . employee. he belongs to last
grade service or in any service notified’
as inferior -for the purpose "of - this
sub—sectz.on. .

G. BHAVANI PRASAD,
S8ecretary to Goverhment.
Leyislative  Affairs & Just:l.;:e,
Law Department.



219
ACT No. 26 OF 1998.

*[16th August, 1998.]

'AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA

PRADESH PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION

- OF AGE OF SUPERANNUATION) ACT, 1984.

Be it enacted by the Legislative
Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh
ifi the - -Forty-ninth Year of the Republlc
>f India, as follows°—

*{Received the assent of the Governor cn the 76-08- 1998,
For statement of object ard reasons piease see the Andhra

Pradesh Gazette, Pq;t—YV ~A, Extraordinary dated 22-07- 1998
-.at Page 4-5.]




220 .

| ehaldk fitle 1. Phis Artikay b2 called the Andhra
'Shorttltle' Pradesh Public Em.lovment (Requlation of
Thge xof:; Supe*‘annum ien} {(Amendment} Ack,
1998.‘
ﬁ‘?ﬁﬁ% 2. - Xm - the  Andhra. Pradesn  Publig
tioni, ASE Pknolnyment (Regulatlon of &ge .of Super—
23 of 1934 annuation) Act,1984 (hprelnafter referred
- ‘to 'ag the; Principal Pct), in. section 1,
;:;;_:‘--,:~a.t'terr-sub—hectlon {3}, -the s:ollom.ng

- mi g0y Shall, be: adde.d., na.nely-'-,:_ o

"(4) sub—sectlon “tan)” of" SECtlon 3
shall be deened to have come 1nto- force
on the 26th Decembe:r' 1992"

srerny EN R

Amendient 7 YT 33In Secta.on 370% the Dr.mc:.pal

. of Rectitn 3Act, “FEter sub<section’ (1), the Lollow—
ing shall be :Lnserted, namely'-f

"{In) -Nor.wlthstan'dlng anything con-
"teained in sub-section (1), every nember
of the Andhra Pradesh . State- Higher Juddi—
cial Service Or the: Andhra Pradesh State-
Judicial ~Sexvice shall retire -from -
service on the. afternoon.of ythe last day
.of the month in which he:- attains. the age
of sixty years: . . ’

Provided that-any such membar of the
Andhra Pradesh State Higher Judicial
srvice or the Andhra Pradesh State
Judicial, Serv1ce _may ‘be compulsoiily
ratired fron service on the-afternoon’ of
the 1ast day of the meonth in which he.

- attains the age of fifty eight years if
‘he is  not fourd fit and eligible to be
continued in Sservice by the Righ. Court
“of Andhra Pradesh on an asSessment and’
evaluation of the rececrd.of such member
for his continued utiiity well -within



221 o i
fime_beforefhe attains the age of fifty
eight years by following the procedure
- for compulsory -retirement under the
-¥ules applicable to him:.

. Provided further _that any such .
member - of thé Andhra ~ Pradesh State
. Higher . Judicial Service or the- Andhra
‘Pradesh State "Judicial service at' his
option to be exercised in writing before’
he attains the age of fifty seven years
may retire from service on the afternoon .
of the.last day of the month in which he
attains the age of fifty eight years.

- Explanation: ‘The assessment . and
evaluation .by the High Court of Anghra
Pradesh for .the purposes -of this 'sub-
section is in addition tc¢ and independent
of the assessment for ccmpulsory retirew
ment. that may have to be undertzken at’
any other time uhder the relevant rules
.applicable to such members of the Andhra
Pradesh State Higher Judicial Service or
~the * Andhra - Pradesh State  Judieial-
T Servicen . - o

' .. G. BHAVANI PRASAD, -
‘secretary to Government,. .
Legislative.Bfﬁairs_&fJustice; .



4___ ANDHRAPRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY _[Part IV-B

(3) The service conditions of the employee of State Cadre /
Multi-zonal Cadre working provisionally in the State of Andhra Pradesh
and finally aliotted by the Government of India under sub-section (2)
of section 77 of the said Act, 2014 to the State of Telangana shall be
governed by the relevant laws / rules of the State of Telangana on
such final allotment.”.

T. NARAYANA REDDY,
Secretary to Government (I/c),
Law Department.

Registered No. HSE/49 [Price :Rs. 0-30 Paise.

' 80|f D0 Do) @i
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

NO.4] HYDERABAD, FRIDAY, JUNE 27, 2014

ANDHRAPRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS ETC.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature
received the assent of the Governor on the 27th June, 2014
and the said assent is hereby first published on the 27th
June,2014 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information:-

ACT No. 4 OF 2014.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION
OF AGE OF SUPERANNUATION) ACT, 1984.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India, as
follows:-

[1]
A.71



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAOQORDINARY [Part1V-B

— =t
and

— -

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation)
(Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on
the 2nd June, 2014.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment
(Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984,

. (hereinafter referred to as principal Act) in section 3,-

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section
shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Every Government employee shall
retire from service on the afternoon of the last day of the
month in which he attains the age of sixty years.”

(2) In sub-section (3), under Explanation |, in clause
(a), for the words “fifty eight or sixty years, as the case
may be”, the words “sixty years” shall be substituted.

(3) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the words
“fifty eight years”, the words “sixty years”, shall be
substituted.

3. In the principal Act, after section 3 so amended,
the following new section shall be inserted, namely:-

Savings. |3A. subject to the provisions of section 3,-

(1) A Government employee belonging to the
State Cadre/Multi-zonal Cadre and who by general or

June 27, 2014] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

specific order of the Government of India under sub-section
(1) of section 77 of the Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation
Act, 2014, and serving provisionally in connection with the
affairs of the State of Telangana, and if he is finally allotted
to the State of Andhra Pradesh by the Government of India
under sub-section (2) of section 77 of the said Act, 2014
shall be deemed to be continuously serving in the State of
Andhra Pradesh.

(2) A Government employee belonging to the State
Cadre / Multi-zonal Cadre falling in the territories of both
the State of Andhra Pradesh and the State of Telangana,
who by a general or a specific order of the Government of
India under sub-section (1) of section 77 of the said Act,
2014, is serving provisionally and retires on attaining the
age of fifty eight years and on his final allotment,
subsequently to the State of Andhra Pradesh by the
Government of India under sub-section (2) of section 77 of
the said Act but before attaining the age of sixty years, shall
be re-inducted into service / post with effect from the date
of his final allotment to the State of Andhra Pradesh without
break in service:

Provided that an employee who attained the age of
sixty years before the final allotment to the State of Andhra
Pradesh by the Government of India, the service rendered
in the State of Telangana till the date of his retirement shall
be considered notionally as if, he has rendered service in
the State of Andhra Pradesh for the purpose of calculation
of his pensionary benefits.



	1997AP19.pdf
	1997AP19.pdf
	1998AP26.pdf

	4 of 2014



