
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1989 
 

Act 10 of 1989 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Beer, To Bottle, Denaturant, Excisable Article, Excise Duty, Export, Import, 
Intoxicant, Liquor, Manufacture, Pachwai, Place, Sale, Transport 
 
Amendments appended: 4 of 1994, 20 of 1994, 28 of 1998, 11 of 2000 ,10 of 
2005, 11 of 2005, 12 of 2005, 39 of 2006, 1 of 2010, 8 of 2010

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


5:: 1.. (1) This AeL ma;, be called the Andhra 
'" ' O m -  Pradesh Exelse (~mendment)  Act, 1909. 
mencencnt. 

(2) (a) section 6 shall be deemed,.to 
have  come into force o n  the 1 s t  December, 
1981; 

,+ 
(b] .sections 17 and -18 shall be 

deemed to have come into force on the 1st 
January, 1987; and 

( c )  t h e -  remaining provisions shall 
4:: 

be deemed to have come into force on the 16th 
September, 1988, 

Amcndnent 2. '1n the Andhra pradesh Excise Act, 196B 

O f  sect(Pn (hereinafter referred ta as the  principal Act)  ; 
2 m  Act l 7  i, section 2, to clau5e (331,  the, words "and 
Or 196Sn  includes, to move from a place outside the 

State to any other place outside i t  through 
the intervening acea lying vrithin the State" 
shall be added at the end. 

Subst leu-  
t,Dn of  3. For section 5 of the principal Act ,  the 

s c ~ t l o n  lor followinq section shall be substituted, namely:- 
s e c t i o n  5 .  

mAppcintmcnt 5.  (11 The Government may appoint 
of  ecrts ln an Additional Cummissloner of 
offlCPPS Excise, ~irector of Distilleries and 
s t t r f .  Breweries. as many Deputy Corn- 

mlssianers o Excise, . Assistant 
Commissioners of Excise and such other officers 
as they think f i t  for the purpose of perform-. 
ing the iunctions respec,tively cotilerred on 
them by or under this Act. 

(21 The Government may  sanction the, 
appointment of a,s many Excise Superin,tendents, 
Assistant, Exel=- 5uperintendents and other 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


Subordinate Staff as they think fit for the 
purpose of performing the functions respee- 
tlvely conferred on them by or under this Act., 

(3)  The appointment to the .posts $an- 
cdoned in sub-seetion ( Z ) ,  shall be 'made b,y 
such authority as may be .  prescribed. ' 

( 4 )  A l l  such offlcefs shall perform the 
said functions w i t h i n  such area. or areas or 
in, the whole of the State as the- Government 
or the Commissioner may assigri to them.". 

4 .  Sections 6 and 7 of the principal Act oaisslan of 
s h a ~  be omitted.  section's 6 

rnd 7. 
5 .  In section 11 of the principal Act, for Abcndmcnt 

sub-sect l~n ( I ) ,  the IwLlowing sub-section if sectfon 

shall. be substituted, namely:- 11. 

"(1) The Governmerit may; by noti'fica- 
Uon, prohibit or'regulate the -transport of an 
intoxicant or any kind of intoxicants from 
any area into any other area within the 
State or . ftom any place outside the S t a t e  to 
any other place outside it through the inter- 
vening area' lying within the State,  ' excep t  
-under..a permit issued under section 12.". 

- . 6. In section 12 of the prlndpal Act, for Rmendaknt. 
sub-section (1). the following sub-sectlon. of set ti^^ 
shall be substituted, namely:- 12.- 

" (1 )  Any offlcer not below the rank OF 
an Assistant Excise Superintdndent authorised 
by the Commissioner may lssue a permit for 
t h i  transport of . in tox icants .  " . 

-7. In .section 24, Of the principal Act, sub- ~mendmcnt 
section (3) shell be omitted. of  scctlon 

24. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


,Amendment. 
of i e c t l o n  

27. 

, 8 .  In seetion 26 of the principal ~ c t ,  the- 
words ''which shall not exceed the duty paya- 
ble therefor, under this Act'' shaU be omitted. 

' 9. In  section 27 or the prinelpal Act, 

(a)  the words "belqnglnq to the Govern- 
ment" s h a l l  be omitted; 

(b)  in the marginal -heading, the word 
"Government" shall he omitted. . 

10:- In ssctlon 31 . of the principal Act, in  
sub-section (1 ) , -- . 

(a] in the open!ng portion, after 'the 
words " m a y  cancel or suspend it", the words 
"irrespective ,of the ' period to which the Ucence 
or permit ?elatestt . shall be inserted; . 

@) ' , in  clause (dl  ,-- 
. . 

(i) ' for '{ha expression "the . ~ a n ~ e r o u s  - 7  

D*gs -Act. 1930", the expression $*the Narca;ics 
Drugs and Psychotropic' substances- Act,  194Y' 
and for the evpresslon ,'!Customs Act,  -62; or". 
the . expression ''Customs Act, 1962 irrmspecllve 
of 'the, fact. whether such canvietion relates to 
the period earlier- or subsequent ta the-grant 
of licence or permit: or: ;-ahall ba mubstituted; 

- '(Fi) in -the margin : for the expressian 
-"Central Act 2 ot 1930'. the exprnssion "Central 
Act 61 of 1985". ?hall ,be : eubstltuted, 

11. I n  seetion- 34 df m e  priricip&l AFt. i n  
dausm (i), -for the -wgrda "less than two years ' 

but whfeh ahaU not  oxceed five years and with. 
f* - - ~ h i c h  may extmnd to five thoumhd n t p e s w ,  

. . . ,  - 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


; , the words ml'ess than 'slx months and with  
fine which shall not be less -than five t imes 
the value of t h e  duty payable but s h d l  not 
exceed ten, Umes of such value i n  case where 
the value of duty is assessed, and in other 

,cases. w i t h  fine which qhau not be .less than 
five thousand r'upees" shall. tjB substituted. 

12. In section 37 of the principal Act, in Amendment 
clause (dl, for- the viorrjs llshaU,- on convic- a f  aection 
tion, be punished with  lmprlsonment for a 31 .  
term which m a y  extend to three months and 
wlth fine which m y  extend to, five hundred - 

rupess", the following sha l l  be substituted, 
namely :- 

" ~ h a l l ,  on conviction, ,he punished with 
impri~sonment, -- 

(i) i r t  the .case of first - offence, for a 
te rm which s h a l l  not be less than six months 
and w i t h  which shall not be -less than 
five times the amount of duty payable but ' 
shalt not exceed ten times of such duty;- and 

(Fi) .in the case .-of c o n ~ n u i n ' ~  offence 
for a term which shall hot-  be less than two 
years, and w l t h  fins which shall not be l e s s  
than ten t imes  -the amount of- .  tlie duty 
payable.''. . 

13. -In section 40 of the pr indpal  Act,- mtnd~tnt 
of smtHbn 

(a) for the words "be punished lor 40. 
each such nffehce w i t h  . imprisonment for a 
term which m a y  extend to six months and 
with. fine ,which m a y  extend t o  one thousand 
rqpeesaaf, the following shall be substituted, 
.namely : - 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


I1bc punished rvfth imprisonment, - ' 
(I) In the case- of 'fitst offence, for a 

term which shal l  not be less than threc 
-months and with f ine which shal l 'not  he less 
'than one thousand rupees; shd. 

iri the case oL second end sub- 
sequent offences for a term which shall. not 
be Icss than six months and w i t h  f i n e -  w h i t h  
shall not be Icss than trvo thousand rupees."; 

4bl in the marginal heading, the word 
"Government" shall be omittod. 

Pnesdlaent 14,. In sec t ion  41 of fhc principal Act,  for 
O? sfctlon the words l1t.wo: hundred rupce:", the words 
41 .  "five thousand rupees" shall be- 5ubstituted. 

AnondaJnt 
o f  srctrm 

15. In 'section, 4 3  of . the prinipal Act, 

43.  
the priviso shall  be omitted. - 

lnsert lon 16. After section 43 of- t h e  principal  A&. 
of  ncwscc- the foLlowlng section shall be Inserted, 

' t l a n  438. namely :- . - 

V u n l  shmnt- 43A. W lloever being a Ucensoe 
f a r a l l a w l n q  under thLs Act and 'having t he  
p r c d a c s  a<.,. control or USQ of any house,'ruom, 
. t o  be usnd e n c ~ o ~ u r e ,  space, animal, convey- 
f o -  c a c d , s l o n  ancn Icnorrin~ly permits I t  ta bc 
o r  Ln offence, used lo; th~ :  commlssbn by any 

othc-r gcrson o; an offence punlsiic- 
blc ciider any provision of rhls 
A z t ,  shall hv punlshsbfk in thr: 

7 Itb2nn&~ a?. I! he t; -: himself ccnm!trcr! 
.: : .--z!.d offenc?. ". 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


17. In section 47 of the principal Act,-- Imendmcnt . 
or 5cct ton 

(I)  IW sub-seetion ( I ) , - -  47. 

{a) for the words "The Cornmiss loner .  
the Collector or any Exclse Officer1', the words 
"The Cdlectmr or any Excise Officer" shall  be 
substituted;' 

(b) Ior the ~xpress ion  llclause (b), 
clause ( c ) ,  Clause ( d l ,  qlause (g), or clause 
(h) of section 54, section 35". the exprsssion 
"clause [ c ) ,  e la~ise  (dl;  clause (g) or clause 
(h) of section 34" shall be substltuteU; 

(GI for the , words ,"iive thousand 
rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" 
sha l l '  be substituted; 

.(lib in sub-seetiori ( 2 ) ,  after the words 
"as the case -may be", the  expression "in 
accordance with the provisions 'of sub-section 
(1) or section 47A"  and after the Mords 
"shal l  be instituted", the wo~ds~lor  continued" 
shall be inserted; 

18. After section 47 of the principal Act. ~ n s c r i l o n  
the following section shall be inserted, o f  nc? s c c -  
namely: - t l o n  47h. 

'Spct la1 b7n .  11) Any persor. rvho is 
pnvcrs o f  t i l e  reasonably . susp=ctet i  of hav ing  
coemls~r, ,nr cammitter l  r?:? offence falling uncc. 

i- I n  regar': r a  C ~ : = G S C  (a) 0: section 311 or QEC'C~QI: 
conpounc:.:. 1:; may apuiy  I,! :he ~on$issioncr 

. compnuani;-I,; lik? offencc Sciore c i  offer.,.' - '  - '  

(.-; convic:- -' . 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


(21 On receipt of sueh application, the 
commissioner having regard to the circumstan- 
ces of the case, may in  his discretion order 
for compounding the offence on payment of a 
sum of money by w a y  of campdunding fee ,or 
compensation for the offence dn sueh terms 
and conditions as he deems f l t :  

Provided that the s u m  of money fixed as 
compounding fee or compensation by the C0.m- 
missioner under this section- sha l l  not he less 
than five t imes but not more than ten t i m e s  
the duty involved and where . n o  duty i s  
irivolved not less than rupees flfteen thousand 
but not more than rupees one lakh: 

P r ~ v i d e d  fur the^ that in all cases in 
which any property has been seized as liable 
to confiscation under this A c t ,  may be ordered 
by h i m ,  to be released on paymentm nf the 
value thereof as estimated by him or by an 
officer authorised by h i m  I n  this behalf: 

PrivIded also that where the - property SD 

seized is a lLquor manufactured in contraven- 
tion of this Act,  such liquor shall not be 

-released but shal l  be disposed 01 i n  such 
-manner  as may be @rescribed .'I 

Amendment 19. In section 53 -of the principal Act, in 
o f  s e t t i o n  sub-sectlon ( I ) ,  in clause (a) for the expres- 

.53 .  sion , "section 3Q", the expresslon "section 27 
or section- 34 or" shall b e  substituted. 

Anendmant 20. In section 56 of the principal Act, in 
swctlon sub-section ( I ? ,  lor ' the expression "sectian 

56.  34", the expression "section 27, section 34" 
shall be substituted. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


21. 1n the Schedule 'FQ the p r i n c i p e ~  Act.- AaendmCst 

Of the 
(i) against item I, in the entry under Sehcduls. 

column (4), for the Hiordl "Rupees Qlght", the 
words "Rupees twenty" shall be(substltuted; 

i l l )  against i t e m  2, ' in the entry ~ n d e r  
column (4), for the words "Rupees threeef, the  
n o ~ d s  "Rupees five" shall be substituted; 

(iii) against item 3, dn the entry under 
column (41,  for the wqrds 'i~upees forty", the 
words  "Rupees eighty" shall be substituted; 

Iiv) against ' i t e m  4, in the entry under. 
column (41, tor the wmds "Rupees'forty'> the 
words "Rupees eighty" shall be sutstituted; - 

(v) for i t e m  5 and the entzhs =dating 
thereto, the following. shall be substituted,-' 

"5,Toddy On each variety 
of the. following 
excise trees: - 
Date or Sendh? . . Rupees twenty 

per tree : 
Palm yrah . . Rupeei thirty 

per tree. 
Coconut . . Rupees fifty 

per tree. 
Sago . . Rupees sixty 

per troc. 
Dstepalm . . Rupees Fifty 

per, tree. " 

if. 1998/6 , 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


' Y4''aut'on. 22. Where, .before thm 16th September, 1988, 
ahy permit has been is4ued far the transpor- 

- tation of .intoxicants and any special, powers 
, were exercised;. ln  regard to  compounding- of 

offences, by the conmi ssioner, the permit so 
issued . and. the' special power& so axerclsrd, 
s h d l  be deemed to have been validly issued 
or exerdsed 'in accordance ' wlth the'provisions 
of the prkcipal Act .as .amended by this Act, 
as if thi 'Gmendments made to the prlnefpal 
Act,. by sections -6,17 and 18 of this Act had 
been in force at.' all material t imes and accor- 
dingly. all- acts, proceedings or things done 
or- taken by the Gwernment- ,or by ark of f icer  
OF the Government or- by any other authority 
in connection -3;ith the -issue of such permit 
or compounding of offences sha l l  Eor alJ pur- 
poses, be deemed to be and to h d e  always 
been done or Laken in accordance with  l a w .  

Repeal . 23. The Andhra Pradesh Excise ( ~ m w n d m e n t )  
~ r d i n a n t c  - Ordinance, 1988 is hereby repealed. 
12 o! 19ea. 

. . 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


ACT No. 4 O F  1994. 

115th January,  1994.1 

AN ACT FURTHER TO MIEND THE t+NDiBA PPLADESH 
FXCZSE ACT, 1968. 

Be it enacte? by fhn Legislntive 
Assembly of the Sta te  of  Andhra ~ r a d e s h  in 
Lhe Forty-four~;h Year of the Republ ic  of 
Sndla as follows:- 

1 ,  ( 1 )  This -Act m y  be called the:Shart 
Andhra Pradovh Exclse (Aaendment) A c t , . t i t l e  anc  

1994 - ,  
Conmen ce- 

'nont .  
-(2) It s h a l l  be deemed to hayo come 

into force on r.he 26th November, 1993. 

-Recclued the, arspnt o f  t h e  Governor on the  15th 

January, 1gGdr For Statement of object5 a n d  Reasons, .. . 
P l e a s e  s r s  t h e  Andhra Pradesh G a z e t t e ,  Part I V - A ,  Ext ra -  
ordinary, d a t ~ d  the  23rd Decrmber, 1993 at Parre 9-11. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


h-mnkent o f .  2 .  Ic the Andhra Pradesh Excise k t ,  
section 2,  :L968  (heqeinafter referred to as t h e  

17 bf A p r i n c i p a l  act j in sec'iion 2, - ,  

1968. (i) for clause 3 ,  the f o l l o w i n g  s h a l l  
bz s u b s t i t u t e d ,  namely  :- 

' "(3) "bottle" means to t rans fer  licucr 
from one cask to a n o t h e r  cask or from a 
cask o r  vessez to a bottle, j a r ,  flzsk, 
pot, closed packet-, basket ,  tin, barre l ,  
case, receptacle, bag,  sack or wrapper . 

or acy a t h e r  recepEicle---in any form in 
which any intoxYcan:: is packed for the. 
purpose of sale w h e t h e r  o r  not  any 
process o f  manusacture is employed pnd 
includes , r e -bo t t l i ng . ;  " ; 

(li) in c lause  . ( 5 )  for t h e  words " the  
District Revenue Officer", t h e  ~ o r d s  "the 
J o i n t  Collector" s h a l l  be s u b s t i t u t e d .  

Subs~itution 3. For . sect ion  34  .of t h e  principal 
c E ~ r u s c c t i o n  A c t ,  the following sec t ion  s h a l l  b e  sub-  
ior scc~ion 3.4. s t i t u t e d  , namely : -, 

"penalties 34 - "hqzver, i n  Contravention 
for iuegal of  this A c t  or of any rule, 

notification or order  made, "'o", "'.\ - 
l s s u e d  or passed t h e r e u n d e ~  2r 

or any l~cence or permit granted or. 
issued under this A c t , -  

( a ) , i m p o r t s ,  exports ,  t ranspor ts ,  
manuf acturas ,  collects- or -possesses ar 
s e l l s  any i n t o x i c a n t ;  or , . . 

(b) tzps any excise tree; or 

( C  d r a ~ i s  toddy f roa. any excise tree; 
or 

( d )  c o n s t r u c t s  or works any. d ~ s ' - i l l e r ~  
or b r ~ w e k y ;  or 

(e) uses, keeps or has  in i r i s  posse: 
sion any materials, stills, u t e n s i l s , .  
inplementsor  apparatus whatsoever for  the 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


' p u < ~ ) o s . i  of,. nanuf a ~ c u r i n y  any in tuxictnt 
pther than, roddy ; or 

(f bottles any.' liquor f o r  purposes 
of sale; or 

(9) buys aEy intoxicent; or 

( h )  passesses any matrlr.iial or fila 
either w i t 1 1  or withcut  Govcznlpent 1~; jo .oE 
any d i s t r i c t  i r l  t h e  State of PnZhra 
Predesh or any other State or wrapper or 

'say other thing in which intoxicants can 
be pzcked or 2np apparatus, or i n p l e n ~ n t  
or machine , T o t  the pdrpose of packing acy 
intaxicant; 

(i) rznoves any intoxic&,ltr. froa any 
d i s t i l l e r y ,  h r w e r y  or wars housz l i cen-  
sed. e s t a b i l i s h e d  or corrr.inue5 under t h i s  

.AcC ; 

shall an c o n v i c t i o n  kc punished,- 

(1) in- the case cf an offence falling 
under clause [a),- 

f i) *.I~er= t!lc ineox ican t  .ir.voX\-zd in 
t h e  'of fence is less than such qu:nti:y as 
nay be n o t i f i e d  'in t h i s  behzlf with  
imprisonment for a tern which s h a l l  nct 
be less thzn s i x  pqnths but . w h i c h  may 
extend upto three years and w i t h  fine 
which shall nct .be less than  rupees five 
thoilcand but which nay ext~nd ?1~;to. i u p ~ b s  
twenty  thousand; 

(ii) ' where the intoxicant j . r .vc l~ed .  i u  
t h e  offence is ndt less than the q d a n t i t p  
n o k i f i e d  as aforgja- id :vith- irnfxieonmen+- 
for a term xhic11 sl:a31 not: 50 l t?c= than 
cce , P a r  and which mr extend upto f i v e  
ycars and with fine which shal-L hot. he- 
less then rupees t e ~ a  tn0usor.d but ~ r h i c h  
may. extend upto rupees ane lakh; ~ s d  _ 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


( 2 1  i n  the case of e;l o:Eenc..- , i l t ? ~ e .  
t h a n  an cffenc? f a l l i n g  unaer c l e u s e  (a) 
w i t h  i n p r i s o n r r c n t  l i h i c h  :iti?ll n o t  be less 
than ~i:? m o n t h s  bu: t h i c k  nzv extend to 
one  k - p a r  and r;rith ,Cine vhich nay extend 
upto rupee; t e n  thoosand :'. 

hadzcor of . 4 .  :n section 3 6  of  tkn principal' A c t ,  
section 3tr. ~n clause {g) for t h e  words "child .appa- 

r e n t l y  under e i g i i t ~ e n  yetrs of age or 
perm i t s  01 sbf ierz such c h l l d "  , the ~ i o r d s  
" ~ e r s c n  apparently under :i.ve~ty onc years 
of eq2 or. >emlira 91 s ~ f f 4 z z  ~uc:? 2 e r ~ o n "  
ska l .1  KG- -~!:ks:ir:tcd. 

L~cnLccae o.€ 5. Ir; secxian 3 7  u: t h e  p r inc ipa l  
secrioi 3 7 .  , ~ c t  ,- . 

(3) a f ~ e z  clause ( a ) ,  t h e  ipllot.'in:; 
clause shall be iasEzredr narzely: 

"(el m a k e s  any bl5ck Eor p r i n t i n g  
caunterf eit e ~ c l s c  adhes ive  l a b l o r  photo 
c o p i e s  of such 12hle fo r  counte~feiting~ 
pzints any counterreit c x c i s c  kdhcsive 
lzkle, rnzkes c o u n t e z f e i t  cork or capsule, 
to be used on b b t t l a f ,  3acKaycs or Other 
rcce ,ptac lss  containing I n d i a n  l~quor or 
f cre ign  l iquor or r passesslon af 
counterfeit excise e l h c s i v e  lahle, cork,  
espsule, block o r  eny othex natdr iz l  to 
bc used f o r  prin:.ing such la512 or making 
S , U C ~  cork GT C S F S ' I ~ C . " ~  

tb) for j terns i i  1 and (ii), the f o l lou-  
l n g  items s h a l l  be suhstitugcd, namely:- 

"(i] in czse of f i r s t  offence Lor a - 

term which shall not b e  l ess  than one 
yaar but which msy extent u?to thzee 
years and vitn f i n e  w t i c h  shall no t -  he 
less k h a n  r~goes t e n  tnausand but rihich 
zay extend cy cu .'u-ees t h i r t y  tiou;and : 

[li! ir: the czse ci a sl~coad or scb- 
scgue3r. o : i + l n c  fcr a ~ Z L - I :  which s h a l l  
not bc less 2 P . m  ?do yez rc  bat which nzy 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


cxtcnd. L:P';O t h r e e  years and w i t h  g i n e  
which  skiall no= be less than rupees f i f t y  4-  
thousanc'. b c t  w h i c h  ma:; e:itcnd upto rupees 
one Iaki'l". 

6 .  AEI;e_r scctlon 37 or' t h e  p r i n c i p a l  h ~ s c r c i o n  of I 
A c t ,  t i l e  fol%oviny srciion s h z l l  be nclr scction 
insexred, n a n d  y : - 37 a. 

< 
. . (i) if, 2s a r e s u l t  of 3nch an acc 

. c l s a h i l i t y  or grievous hurt or death is 
czused to any person, with inprisonaent:  
foz  2 tern u h i c h  sh.311 not L e  Icss than 
t y r o  y e a r s  ,but vl i ich may extend u ~ t o  

I i m p r i s o n ~ e i j z  f o r  life, and w i t h   fin^ 
which may extend upco rupees one lakh; 

"Peaaity for 27 A. '(1) ilhoever inixes or 

(ii) in zny other  case, with inprison- 
nent for a term which shall n o t  be less 
t h a ~  one yea:, Sut  which mzy extend upto 
ten years,  an2.  with Cine w h i c h  nay extend 
p t o  f i f t y  thcusand ru?ees. 

z d u l i c r a t i o n  
r c s d r i c g  i n  
~ t s r h  C ~ C .  

Explanation: For  tile pusposes of :h i s  
section, the expression "grievous hurt" 
shall have t h e  s m e  meaning as in s~ction *ntraL"t45 
320 of t h e  I n d i a n  Penal Code, 1860. o f  186@. 

permits to be m i x e d  with any 
liquor or i n t o x i c a t i n g  drug 
any nosiocs substance  or ;iiy 

( 2 )  Whoever omits .  to take reasonzjle 
p r e c ~ u t i o n s  zo prevent the nixing of any 

.noxious substance or any substance which 
is l i k e l y  to cause d i s z b i l i t y  o r  grievous 
hurt DL d e a t h  to human b e i n g s ,  w i t h  any 
l i qso r  or i n t o x i c a t i n g  firuq s h z l l ,  on 
cun i r i c t  icr , h2 ?un$sh&ble, - 

- - subs",ncc c ~ h i c h  i s  I l k z l y  to 
czuse dis~bility ur ~ ~ E V O U S  h u r t  or 
d e z i b  iO hsnan be ings ,  '~;:rl~11, on C O ~ V ~ C -  
t i o n ,  be u n n i s h a b l e ,  - 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


{i) if as a,result of s u c h  onissicn, 
dtszbilify o r  qrievocs hurt is c ~ u s f d  -:o 
zny person, +:?ith in~risonment fcr 2 ?fir:> 

:inich sna l l  no t  h e  less thzr  t:.;o yezrs  
5at which nay extend u3to impriso;ln.;nk 
foi life, and w i t ! l  fine which  nsy cx tcnd  
u p t o  rupees one lakkt; .. -- - ---- , 

(ii) if as a r e s u l t  of such omission, 
dea th  is c2useC to zny person, w*;n 
ix;lprisor?ment f o r  & ternt which s h a l l  not 
be less than t h r e e  years but which nEy 
extend upto imprisonment f o r  l i f e ,  an6 
with i ' ine  : ~ h i c h  nay extend upkc rupees 
o n e  lakh; 

Iiii) in any other case, witn i a ~ p r i -  
sonmcnt  of a tern w h i c h  s h a l l  n o t  be less 
t h a n  o n c  ye;r  but v i ~ i c h -  may e:rtend, ugto 
t c n  yea::: ;ad w i t h  fine :qhj.ch nr?y &-Lend 
cpto rasccs Lifty thouszrid. 

( 3 1  Whoevcl- possesses any l i c_uo r  o r  
intoxicatinn d r u g  i n  v t i c h  zny  scbstance 
=@?erred LD i n  s l lh-sec t ion  (1) is m i x e d ,  
knowiaq t:- .g? p.l lci~ substance is nixed with 
such l i q u o r  or iaxoxicrting drcg sIlal l ,  
0 2  cr .~ \ - j  r z i o n ,  h e  ~ u r 1 ~ ~ 1 : a u l e  u i t h  i m p r i -  
scnnen:. tor  a t e r n  which shall n o t  bc 
l e s s  t h a n  one yezr hut which Kay extend 
2;to tell y c ~ r s ,  33d tdi ' i ;? f i n e  which ?cy 
e:<ker.d :12t3 rupees f i5C:x  t ~ : o i l ~ a n d " .  

, 7. .'L.ftex sec t ion  < O  of ~ l l c  p r i ~ c i p l  
nc,, scctiuu k t ,  the folI.o:si?.g seck ibn  s h a l l  he 
<ri:,. . inserted, ni;.iely :- 

: ' rent i t ) .  f o r  <1)1. i.inssce.;kr i n  a n y  c c c l z = j -  
Enl-c 3 ~ 2 : ~ -  L i o n  or af Eic iav i t  azec LO 2;: 

zenc ;;rZe j.11 X:<cise r3:fic~r m:ces  i;2y st:..re- 
r'.ucl;raiion iccni: ?lllj.ch i s  fzLse or io1:ne 
n r  ;-:iic.:':ic. to b o  false after, due v z r i i i -  , 1 ca t i on  o r  ~ h i c h  he h ~ l i c * ; c s  to 

be  f a i s 2  or Cots n o t  bolie-:c 
i r -  c - Lo ke true, tour;:?iz? LEY pohn: r ~ e t c r i a l  
t3 tht?  objec:, Ccr : ihicb ezc?arz:ion . 
0:: . ~ i 5 i d ? . v i t  is ;ildr:9 C: USEL shall 5.2 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


punisk.e2 with r i s o e  02 either 
descr lp t io r .  for 3, t r : rm r~: : icb  s h d l l  n o t  be 
less uhcn s i x  ncl:t?:s b d t  i :hich mzy ex tecd  
cgto thre& years  z?d sh -11  2lsa he liable 
tc f i n e  >:hich msy estend upto rup?es- tes ,  
thousaa? ." .  

a. In s e c t i o n  .- ji1 c*C the  p r i r i c l p a l  ~ c t ,  *a~,: 
f c r  t h e  ~ o r d s  "be pun~shed uith fine ,,,rion 1'1. 
which m?.y ertenri  f.o f i v e  thoussnd rupc-cs", 
t h e  words "be pu::;.ishtC with- inprlscnr,r.nc 
~ i k i c h  nay extend u p t o  six ~nonths and rrid;h 
f i n c  which may extcnd upto five thcusznd 
rc?ees" shall be substituted. 

9.  I n  s ec l i c :~  40: of x'ne ~zinci?2L .L=tr keudccnr of 
i?. " c e  ~ r r o v i s o ,  :or t h e  ~ : : ~ > r c s ~ i c z  c~crion , 1 ~ ,  

"ChEpte r  X : < I I  o l  t h e  Code a? C r ~ r n l n e l  
Pzocedure,  1.298", r k e  expressioc " C h k p t e r  
X:!T of  t h e  Code of Cri~ : l i . ' r a l  ? E C C ~ - ~ U ~ C ,  

1?73" shall be s u b s t i t c t e d .  

10. I n  section 45 of tho p r i n c i ~ l  .4ct, k,,,,(,l: 01: 

in sub-sectior: ( 3  ) , the prov iso  s i ~ a l l  be scccioa 45. 
c ~ i  tted . 

11. ?n sectio;: -;7 cf tk .1 p r i a c i p a l  brrcnhcnt of 
. f o r  t h e  e..:r-cssl?t ' ' c l a u ~ e  ( c ) ,  .,ctioa 47.  
clzusc.  I d ) ,  cl~,t:se c z  c l a u s e  I h )  of 
s%czr.on 2- ! "  , :he e 2 p r t . s ~  rcn "clause (1) , 
c!:cse i c )  c , ~  cl~:::c ! g )  oE sec t ion  24 ' '  
.- - -..L11 Srt 5 u : s s t i t u t ~ u .  

. . . 2 7 .  I;, r - c zy i on  <7?, 7 ;  'ihe ?z:nclpel k = n d c a l ;  "2 
:'.-t, 11: s u b - z c c t ~ . ~ n  ( I . ) ,  f o r  the c:c?res- ~ ~ c t i o n  4711. 

" f ~ l . ! i n c  !ir.dcr c l ~ u s c  [ 2 )  of sec' i icn 
2' Cc e c c r i o n  34";  the c:ipression "fallinq 
:T.ccr s - c ~ i o n  3 5 "  ~ n ~ l l  'substi:ut-<. 

( i )  f o r  t h e  words "r;.hic:l shall n o t  
cxcecd six z s r n t h s  I>:- w i t h  fir.e-i;:l-i-ci: s h l l  
'nst be less than f s v e  hundrea  ruoees  but 
xhici? s h a l i  2 o t  e x r e d  O i l E  khhousa;ld .-vFecs 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


.. - uklil:ztior. 5 % .  The 0 f f l ~ ~ ~ 6  o f  t h e  
: ; oC Police r-d 

ro ~cv.;::ce s i i z l l ,  n p x ~  n z t i r e  
:LC:? r.t,i~.i-. c~.ve:: or r q u e s z  medz by ?-9 I ----- g::2.se off  ic::l: lc<--r.lLy . . tr;.~z!s to k s ~ ; : : :  h i m  in rrrlriyiflg o u t  t h e  
~;rovj .z iczz p i .  the i~c t ." .  . 

.';<!.%<<::I: t,f 5 ,  in se~:.ioa 55 of ti;+ p z i n c i ? a l  
- . .. -.?., 
,,LL,.<.,.+ 5.2- .-\cc, 52: k l - , ~  a<nr<Pc;3> "OZ Y Z C ~ ~ G ~  37"1 

i;!!e ~ ~ : p = ~ ~ ~ i o ~  u ~ e ~ t J ~ n  37 0' s ~ c t i o n  
:;:-'I y,i.,zL 1 3e :*:3~ yitmL%.te<. 

.I[,. I+, scck ioc  56 02 ~ h . 2  p t - i n c i p ~ l  
.-:,-!:.:-.L27: of  : 

. .,/ I for :!:,z.r:;prescicbn "0;' ;fr:i~:l 17", 
F . . .- ., L..,.- %I.. > 2 .  ti;,< P>::?rc~~ir-i, ' t 5 L ~ t i ~ r - ~  27 O r  FEC~~:C)C 37A 

o z  s.:ct:a:l .IQaq' 2:ld f o t  hche s::prsssion 
" t h e  ( r r j , : ?  < '  Cr-jr.!j,r:zl 2rocc<ur9. I & Y 3 " ,  
;>$ c : c ~ r e ~ s ~ o ~  "t?e code of C r i n i a a l  Ftq- 
~ ; C I : ~ R ,  j . 3 ~ 3 "  s;,?ll be substitatei. 

17. L.z s e c ~ i o n  57 of the u z i n c i p s l  
&7-': +15-.t of -- 

A,,, C . 3 5  t17e e . ~ 0 ' 3 5 ~ : - : ~ ; 1  " s e c t i o n  13D.0i' t h e  
sczziur 57. Csde o i  cziair.al p~ucr:6crc ,  1998'' t h e  

c:pr~.;sicr. "r-,ectio;l 100 of t h e  Cod? O f  , 

Cri-.i:~e!. I roccdurc ,  lY7?" s l .a l l  be sub- 
s 2 l  t'2k.l. . l a .  Ili sec t i gn  5 9  id . t h e  -Prj.nclpzL 

cl,c;j,on 59. .;-c?, .:,~cJ ti!c tx3r":ziiln "tki*  CvGe of Cri-- 
nir.a?& ~ r c c e d c r e ,  3688 '' t h e  expression 
" t h c  C C ~ S  R: ~ri i r r ina l  procefiux?, 1973"  a 

s h a L l  GE 5 2 3 s  t i t u t ~ d .  
Kc?-.--I o< 19. ?,:tdl-.ra P r ~ d e s h  Z X C ~ S ~  ( h ~ u - 5 -  
(IT:::Z;?::C~ 10 np::t) '3rdjnzpcs, 1933 i 5  h e ~ e b y  r~pcaled. 
,-,i i??.?.. 

K . Sn'lbYfi:~J~sLAH.~L+A !<URTF.P , 
Sec!+ptF,ry to Go':ernc!?c::, 

~cyi : ; lcc . ice  a i f t i r s .  
L . L ~  Dsp.lzkr.-:s:+. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


TtiE .AMDKtlA PMDESK EXCISE ( S ~ C O ~  .WEND- 
YiN'!) ACT, 1994. 

ACT Xn* 20 OF 1994%. 

[20 th  Y G ~ ,  1994.1 

;& ACT FURTER TO AX&h9 i B E  Ah'UFRLA PP-BSH 
EXCISE ACT, 1968. 

C BE it e r ~ a c t e d  by the LegislatJ.ve Assen- 
bly of the S t a t e  of, Andhra F-cadosh in xho 
Forty-f i f t h  Year of ?:he Repulili r_ of 1z:dia 
93 fo l lows : -  

. - 

1. Thf s A c t  may, be c a l l e d  the Andhra jhcrk 
Pradesh Exclse (SecondAicendment) Arc, 1994. 

Aii,e!ld~::ent c f  
2. In the  hdhra Pradesh Excise A c t ,  s c - c t i o r r  2, 

1968 (hereinafter referred to as the  Act  t i  3 f  1968. . 
p r i n c i p a l  Act), i n  section 2,- 

Ei) fclr c3.ause (91 ,  tho foll.owlng 
clause sh311 be subs t.3 tutcd, namo1.y :- 

*Rece:ved thc h s s e n t  o f  t h e  Governor o n  the 1 3 t h  
r 

Eaj ' .  1994. For Statement crf objects end Reaso~ls .  
Flcasc see Gndhra Pradesh- G a z e t t e ,  Part I V - A ,  E x t r a -  
ordincry, d a t e d  t he  12th Kay, 1994 a t  Page ?. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


372 
-. 

" ( 9 ) "excisable ar~izle" means . any 
alc~holic l i q u o r  for human consumption; or 
?,ny in tox i ca t in9  drugn-; 

( i i) in clause 20,  i n  s u b - c l a u s e  (dl 
fcr , t h e  e x p r e ~  $ion "Dangerous Drugs Act, 
i930", t h ~ .  exl;r-ession "Narcotic Drugs and 
f sychotropie ~ubs<ar.&es A c t ,  1985" -Hnd in 
the margin for t h e  express'ion "Central Act 
2 of 193011, the expression "Central Act 61 
of 1985" shall r e s p e c t i v e l y b e s u b s t i t u t e d . ~  

h n d r ~ c ~ t  of 3 .  In section 37A of the p r i n c i p a l  A c t ,  i n  
f ~ c ~ i m  3 x .  sub-section (1) , in the exp lanat ion ,  for 

the k-ords la this section", the expression 
" t h i s  section and section 37B" s h a l l  be 
s u b s t i t u t e d .  

Insertion of 4.  A f t e r  section 37A, of t h e  principal 
rew section A c t ,  the following section shall be inser- 
373. t ed, narndly : - 

Central k t  "Order fo 37B.. ( 1 ) Notwithstandiny anything 
2 of 1974. pay Conpea- centained i n  the Code of Cr imina l  

sation. A Procedure, 1973 t h e  c o u r t  when 
. - p-assing the  1udyer:ent i n  a case 

f a l l i n g  under section 3 7 A  may, 
if it i s  satisfied that death or gr.ievous 
h u r t  or- disability has  been caused to. any 
person or persons by consumption of liquor 
or intoxicating drug sold in any place, 
order t h e  persGns who sold the l iquor or 
intoxicating drug, whether or not he is 
convicted of an offence under section 37A 
to pay, by way of compensation, such 
m o u n t :  as it deems just, t o  t h e  Legal 
representatives  of t h e  deceased or to t h e  
perscn or persons to whom grievous hurt or 
disability has been caused: 

Provided that where'the l iquor or i n t o -  
xicating drug is sold i n  a licenced shop, 
the l i a b i l i t y  to pay the compensation 
underq'this section shall bf on t h e  licensee. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


(2) Any person aygrieved 'by an order 
under sub-seetion (1) may, within'ninety 
days from t h e  date of t h e  order. prefer  an 
appeal to t h e  High Court: 

Provided that no such appea3. sha l l  l i e  
unless the amount ordered to be paid under 
sub-section (1) is deposited ii the cou r t  
which passed such order: - 

Provided further that the Hiqb Court - 

may entertain the appeal after- t h e  6xpiry 
of the s a i d  period of n i n e t y  days if it is 
satisfied t h a t  t h e  appellant was prevented 
by sufficient cguse from preferring t h e  
appeal in t i m e . " .  - 

5. In -seetlon 4 2  of t h e  principal A c t ,  bvn.fmu*t 415 
a£ ter the expression . "sect ion 3 4 "  t h e  cecri* 42 ,  
expression '!se.ctions 3 7  acd 37AU , s h a l l  be 
'substituted. 

6. For section 4 6  of the  p r i n c i p a l  A c t ,  S ~ i - r i t ~ . r j . , , . ~  
t h e  following sections shal l .  be substituted, of -- 
namely : - tiors f o r  

sectltctn 45, 
46. ( - 1 ) Notwithstanding anythin5 

cases. 
provis ions  of this A t t ,  t h e  
Officer seizing and decaj ning 

such. property s h a l l ,  withcut any unr eason- . 
able delay,  produce the  said .ce.izcd Ero- 
perly before the Deputy Commissio~~er of. 
Excise who has jurisdiction over the area. 

( 2 )  O n  produet ics  of t h e  sa,;.d seized 
property -under sub-sectiun 11 1. the Deputy 
Commissioner of Exc i se  if satisf ied that . 
an offence under this Act has keen C o k t -  
ted, may, whether  or .not  a prosecution is 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


374 

instituted for the Conmission ox s u c h  an 
offence, order, conf iseation of sllcn pr o-- 
perty , 

! 3 ) Wliile making an order of conf i sca- 
t i ~ n  unler sS-sec t ion  ( 2 1 , t h e  beputy Corn- 
niissioner of Excise may a l s o  order that 
such of the properties La which t he  order 
yf conEisczi~Lion relates trhicl? in h i s  opin- 
ion cannot be preserved or are not f i t  for 
human consum?tion be destr~yed . 

. 1 4 )  Where .the Deputy commissioner of 
Excise a f t e r  passing an order of canfisca- 
t i o n  under sub-sec t ion  ( 2 )  is of the opin-  
ion t h a t  it is expedient iq the public 
in teres t  so to do, he may order the confis- 
cated property ox any part there of to be 
s o l d  by publ i c  a u c t i o n  or dispose -of 
depar'm~.tital ly . 

15)  The Deputy Commissicner o f  Exciee 
s h a l l  ~ u b m i t  n f u l l  report of a11 parti-. 
cu lzrs  of conf i sca t ion  to the Comnkssioner 
of Excise  within twenty-four hours of such 
confiscation. 

(6) The Deputy Conyissioner of Excise 
s h a l l ,  fo r  the' purposes 'of this A c t  have 
the same powers as are vested in a Civil 

ktrd  g C o u r t  rlnder t h e  Code of C i v i l  Procedure, 
of 1908. . 1908 when making enquiries under this 

section in respect o f t h e  following matters, 
namely:- 

( a )  receiving evidence on a f f i d a v i t s :  

i hl surnruoniny 'and enforc ing  the att en- 
- dence of any person and exaning him 
cn oath; and 

( c )  compelling the prcduction of docu- 
ments. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


4 6 A .  N o  order of c o n f i s c a t i o n  cf  
any property s h a l l  be made under 
cection 46 unless' &he person 
from whom the  sa id  property is 

s e i z e d , - .  7. 

( a )  is gi .ven a not ice  i n  writing 
informing him of the grounds on wnich it 
is proposed to confiscate  such property; 
and • 

q tbl i s  givec an opportunj.ty of making 
a representation in writing w i t h i n  such 

s reasonable t ime as may be specified in the 
notice. 

t h i s  Act, and n o t  i n  t h e  posses- 
s ion  , of - any ., person cannot be 
satisfkctorily accounted for ,  

t h e  ExciSe Superintendent map by order 
confiscate such proper ty :  

Provided that no such o r d ~ r  shall be 
made until t t e  expiration of  -one ~ o n t h ,  
from the date  of seizing the goods in ten-  

1 ded to be confiscated. 

A P M ,  '1 46C.  Any person aggrieved* by 
an order gassed by Deputy Com- 
missioner of E x c i s e  under sec- 

tion 4 6  may, w i t h i n  sixty days from the 
date of passing such crder, appeal to the 
Commissioner of E x c i s e ,  who may a f t e r  
~ i v i n g  reasonable c2portunity to t h e  eppel- , 

l a n t  pass such orders as te deems f i t .  
. . 

Order of ' 46D. The o r d ~ r  of con£ i s c a t i o n  
confixca- 
tion not to 

under sub-'section ( 2) of sect ion * 

4 6  or section 46B shall n o t  prevent 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


front initiation of criminal pro- 
ceedings against the accused 
under t h i s  A c t .  The result of 
cfiminal proceedings e i t h e r  

acquittal  ur convictlion or otherwise under 
the provisions of t.he A c t ,  w i l l  have no 
bearing on t h e  order .of confiscation 
p a ~ ~ e d  under t h i s  A c t .  

46EI. N~twithstanding ' anything 
contained in the code of C r i r n i m l  
Proce2crer 1973 when t h e  Deputy. 
Conmissioner of Excise or t h e  

.appellate authcbrity i s  se ized with the 
matter under  this A c t ,  no court shall 
entertain any .application i n  respect of 
exci sabl-e articles any package, coveri rag, 
receptacle, any ani-1, v e h i c l e  cr other ' . 
conveyance used in. carrying such articles 
as far  as its re leas~,  confiscat ion is 
concerned and the jurisdiction of the 
Deputy Commissioner of Excise .or t h e  eppel- 
late authority with regard to the d i s p o s a l  
of t h e  same s h a l l  be exclusive. 

4 EF . When , an order for eorif isca- 
tion of i ny property has been 
passed u n d e r  sect ion 46 and ~ u c h  
order has become f i n a l i n  respect 
sf the- w h o l e  or any por t ion  of 
such property, such property or, 

portion thereof, as t h e  ease may be, sha l l  
V E S ~  in Government free from all encvlm- 
brances . '' 

i 
, Insertion of 7 ., A f f  er section 50 of t t ~  ' p r i n c i p a l  Act, 

new sect ion-  t h e  following section shall be in ser ted ,  
SPA. - namely : - 

.50A.. '  Notwithstanding any th ing  
contained in t he .  I n d i a n  Penal  
.code, 1860 whoever assault or 

45 of 1869- , threatens to assault.orohstrucls 
or.attempts L o  ct-struct any Excise Officer 
in t h e  discharge of hi s  official dut ies  in 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


377 
I . .  

t h e  rnatser of detection, seizure,, arrest  , 
investigation, prosecution of :the offences 
under the A c t  or attempts to age criminal  
force en such ~ x c i s e  O f f i c e r  s h a l l  be 
punished with imprisonment for a t ~ - r m  
k h i c h  may extend to three years a ~ f  with 
f i n e  which may extend to ,rupees f i f t y  
thousands.". 

6. In sectior: 53 of t h e  principal Act, inhendmenr of 
sub-section (1 ) , - I section 53. 

(i) f o r  c l a u s e  (a , ) *  t h g  follawjng 
clause shall be s u b s t i t u t e d ,  namely:'- 

" ( a )  arrest wi thou t  warrant any person 
f o r  an offence p u n i s h a b l e  under sect ion 2 7  
or sec t ion  24  or s e c t i o n  35 or section 36 
or sect ion 37 or section 37A or section 
4GA or s e c t i o n  50 or section 5 0 A t f ;  

(ii) in sub-section ( -2)  after t.he 
expression "or sec t i on  37"1 t h e  express ion  
"section 37A or s e c t i c n  50" s h a l l  be 
inserted; 

9. In skct ion 60 of t h e  p r i n c i p a l  A C ~  ,- hendmcnt of 
section 60. 

(i) in sub-section (4);for t h e  expres- 
slon "sections 4 9 9  to 502, s ~ c i i i o n  513, 
S e c t i o n  514 and s e c t i o n  525 of t h e  Code of 
Criminal Procedure, 1898" t h e  expression 
"sections 441 to 4 4 6  and section 4119 of 
the code of C r i m i n a l  Procedure, 1973", 
shall be. subs t i tu ted ;  

(ii) af ter  sub-section ( 4 ) ,  t h e  f o l l -  
lowing sub-section shall be added, naxe1y:- 

" [ 5 1 Notwithat anding anything contained central ~ c t  2 
in t h e  Code - -of C r i m i n a l  Prccedure 19 7 3 ,  of 1974. 
no person accused of an offence under 
clauses (a) and I h )  of section -34  or . 
section 3 7 ,  section 37A, scct icsn.4DAr .sec- 
tion 50 and section 5 0 A  of this Act, the 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


court g h a l l  not rrant any bail, u n l e s s  the 
prosecuting off if-er is given an oygortu- 
n i t y  to oppos~: the asplication, end the 
court s h a l l  record reasons w h i l e  g r a n t i n q  
t t c  b a i l " .  

Eaxdmnt of lC - I n  section 6 2  of the ~ ~ i n c i p a l  A ~ l r  
section 62- for the expression "section 32 of the Ccde 

of C r i m i n a l  Procedure, 1898", the expres- 
sion ''section '29 of t h e  Code of Crimina l  
Procedure, 1S73", s h a l l  be substituted. 

R .  SA'X71ANARnYANA H E ' R T f f i r  
Secretary to Government,. 

~egislative A f f a i r s ,  
Law Gepartment. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


- 
Shor t  

1. (I.) This ,Act may be ca l l ed  the t i t l e  
Andhra P r a d e ~ h  Exc i se  (Amen&ient 1 : A c t ,  

and . 1998. . commence- 
ment. ' 

( 2 )  ,1t shall come into force  at once.  4 

~ r p i n a n t  - -  2, In thz Bndhra pradesh ~xcise A c t ,  
of set- . 1968, in section 32, in sub-section ( 2  , 
tioll'32d after t h e  words "under sub-section (l)",,., 1 

Act 17 of t h e -  words ['or clause (e) of sub-sectiqn 
1968. ' ( l ) ' or' sec$ion 31:' -shzll be Iiiserted. 

+ G.  BEAVANI PRASAD I 

secretary to Government, 
Legislative Pf f airs & Justice. 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


ANDHFW PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND 
REGULATIONS Ete. 

. . 

The £allowing A c t  of t h e  Andhra ~ i r a d e s h  
L e g i ~ l a t i v e  Assembly reckived the assent 
of. the Governor on the 27th April, 2000 
and the said assent is hereby first 
published on t h e  28th ~ p r i l ,  2000 in the 
Andhra Pradesh Gazette  for -general infor- 
matiop: - 

, - 

' ACT Bo. 11 OP 2000 .  

.Re :it- -enmeted  by- t h e  Legiglative 
,- Anaembly of- the S t a t e  of  kndhra Pradtsh 

. in t h e .  P i f ty- f irs t - 'Ye ar '.pf, t h e  Republic 
of..ILndia :pa-.~foll~ons:-. - 

ys .1  

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


shp* 1. This 4 c t  m a y  be called the And,hra 
t i d e - '  . . ' Pradesh Fxcise (WenAnent)  A c t ,  2000 ,  

- 

2 .  In t h e  Andhra Pradesh Excise A c t ,  
Amendment 196R . ( h e , r e i n a f t e r  - referred to as the 
Of p r i n c i p a l  A c t )  .in section 13, to sub- 
13' Act l7 s e c t i o n  (I 1 the following proviso s h a l l  
Of 1968- , he added ; namely :- 

"Provided thzt tiy provisions -of 
this- sub-section, in so far  as they 
r e l a t e  to establishing, continuing or 
l i c e n s i n g  a distillery s h a l l  apply bnky 
to those distilleries w h i c h  manufacture 
sp i r i t s  f o r  potable purpose and regu- 
latory provisions relating tb requlation 
and supervision, shall he appl icable  to 
all distilleries.". 

m n t  3 .  ~ r r  sect ion 16 of the princ ipal  
of s i d O a  A c t ,  after sub-secti,on (3  the following 
16. proviso shall he zdded, namely:- 

"Provided that t h e  provis ions of 
t h i s  section in so far  as they relate to 

, - 'establishing, continuing or licensing a 
d i s k i l l e r y  shall apply only to those 
dist i l ler ies  which manufacture spiritrr 
f o r  potable pnrpose and other regulatory 
provisions relating to regulation and 
Supervision, s h a l l  be applicable to a l l  
d i s t i l l e r i e s  . ". 

G. B H A r n I  P r n A D .  
Secretary to Government, 

~egislative Affairs 2, Justiew, 
Law DcparA%ent . 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


Tne State W-t have W issuing li- rmdes 
sections 13 and 16 oE k h  A n d h a  P r A h  W s e  Ack, 1968 
for' all types of D i s t i l l e e s  -we of tbe 
for which the R M i e d  spir i t  prdaced is pt tb 
use i.e., for l a t r i a l  PPrpose or Potable e for 

. bath. The Ean'ble Sup- aiurt of India by an ardes d a d  
29-1-1997 'in w.P.m.322/96 in R/s aibar Di?iti.Jlsrfes .ad 
others h a s  held *t:- 

(i) i n  the mttex of Mastries where the -a- oE 
R e c t i E i e d  Spirit .IB d b s i v z  far the plrp~x of obtainbg or 
m a n u f a w e  -1e m, such i d a s t r i e s  sha l l  hz uder 
the total and exc1usin veml oE the S k a w  in a l l  

- r e s w ;  

{ii) in the mtter hf Idustries *re kbe &a- m f  
R e c t i f i e d  spirit is for,both bdustr ia l  a=i mtable 
permission to es-isb and regulate the Euaetioning o£ dis- 
til leries shnll W the =lusive OE the Union; 

Iiii) houever. wen In r+rd to i n d u ~ t r i s  tmere the 
entire Rectified spirit 1s s u m e d  Eor i d n s t r 3 . d  
o r . h t h  for idastrial a d  p3-e -, the 7 of tbe 
5 t i t e s  to take necea- s e s  ta e m r e  against ar 
diversion uf ilectified Spirit mt for w, 
Me- during and &ter m u f a c t u r e  of h c ? . i f i d  Spirit 
continues unaffeed. 

In, v i e w  of the d d  w e o n  Of me Apes -t, the 
G w e r u w n t  have decided ta ar ied  sections' 13 a d  16 of the 
Andhra ~ r a d e s h  Excise Act .  l9Ge so as to r e s t r i c t k g  t k  
p w e r  to ,qraat Licems M those - h i u s h i -  nanufacturing 
R e c t i f i d  Spir i t  for potsble ~ u r p s c  d -5 ''&-era- 
m k  or oifiCials oE Prohibieiuh and Excise W-. M 
regulate all the i d a s t r i e s  mnufachring Lhc R e c t i f i d  
Spirit Lor po-le parpose, or Wustrid p e e  or far 
botA so as to amid k h  r i m  or diversion of the R e c M i e d  
s p i r i t  maat Eor Mustid purpose to. he used for potable 
p u r p s c .  

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


- mereas the Anahra Pradesh Excise (Amendment ) . B i l l ,  1999 
has been i n h ' d d  i n  the w x s l a t i v e  Assembly of the State 
w 26th U o v m ,  1998 as L-A. B i l l  1?5. 36 of  1998. the same 
has lapsizd due to :dissolutian of the tenth legislative 
-Y- 

This ~iiJ. W b give ekfect to tba a w e  decision. - AAGEsmRA RAO, 
Minister for erohitiition and Excise - 

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


A-531

[1]

ACT No. 10 OF 2005

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of
Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-sixth Year of  Republic of India as
follows:

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise
(Amendment) Act, 2005.

Short title,
extent and
commen-
cement.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent is hereby first pulished on the
2nd April, 2005 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazettee for general
information:-.

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-15 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA  PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS  Etc.

No. 11]     HYDERABAD,  SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2        ANDHRA  PRADESH  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY        [Part IV-B

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In section 47 of the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968,
in sub-section (1), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the
words   “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

Amend-
ment of
section
47.
Act 17 of
1968.

G.V. SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs and Justice (F.A.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING, AT
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


ACT No.  11  OF 2005.

 AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State
of Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of
India as follows: [1]
A. 532

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent is hereby first published on
the 2nd April, 2005 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information.

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-15 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA  PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS  Etc.

No. 12]     HYDERABAD,  SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2        ANDHRA  PRADESH  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY        [Part IV-B

Short title,
extent and
commence-
ment.

Amend-
ment of the
Schedule.
Act 17 of
1968.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Ex-

cise (Second Amendment) Act, 2005.

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in the
Schedule,-

(a) against  item 2, in the entry under column 4, for the
words “Rupees five”, the words “Rupees fifteen” shall be sub-
stituted;

(b) against item 3, in the entry under column 4, for the
words “Rupees eighty”, the words “Rupees one hundred and
twenty” shall be substituted.

G.V. SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs and Justice (F.A.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING, AT
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


A. 533

[1]

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 31st
March, 2005 and the said assent is hereby first published on
the 2nd April, 2005 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information.

ACT No. 12 OF 2005.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of
Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
as follows:

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh Excise
(Third Amendment) Act, 2005.

Short title,
extent and
commence-
ment.

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-15 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA  PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS  Etc.

No. 13]     HYDERABAD,  SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2005

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2        ANDHRA  PRADESH  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY        [Part IV-B

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra Pradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification, appoint.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968, in section 2,-

(i) after clause (22), the following clauses shall be
inserted; namely:-

“(22-A) “material” includes molasses, wash and such
other substances as the State Government may, by notification,
specify;

(22-B) “molasses” means the heavy, dark coloured
residual syrup drained away in the final stage of the manufacture
of jaggery or sugar or Khandasari Sugar Cane or gur containing
solution or suspension, sugars which can be fermented and
includes any product formed by the addition to such syrup of
any ingredient which does not substantially alter the character
of such syrup but does not include any article which the State
Government may, by notification, declare not to be molasses,
for the purpose of this Act,”;

(ii) after clause (31), the following clause shall be added,
namely:-

“(32) “Wash” includes fermented wort or a dilute
solution of sugar from which spirit is distilled.”.

Amend-
ment of
section 2.
Act 17 of
1968.

G.V. SEETHAPATHY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs and Justice (F.A.C.),
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING, AT
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


[1]
A.188-1

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-30 Paise.

B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B   EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES
AND REGULATIONS Etc.,

No. 50 ]     HYDERABAD,  MONDAY  SEPTEMBER 25,  2006

ACT No. 39 OF 2006

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State
of Andhra Pradesh in the Fifty-seventh Year of the Republic
of India as follows:

1. (1)  This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Excise (Amendment) Act, 2006.

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Andhra
Pradesh.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative
Assembly received the assent of the Governor on the 22nd
September, 2006 and the said assent is hereby first
published on the 25th September, 2006 in the Andhra
Pradesh Gazette for general information:-

Short
title,
extent
and
commen-
cement.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2            ANDHRA   PRADESH  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY             [Part IV-B

(3) It shall be deemed to have come into force on
and from the 25th May, 2006.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968 (herein
after referred to as the principal act), in sub-section (3) of
section 17, for the words “for a period of one year or part
thereof”, the words “for a period not exceeding two years
at a time” shall be substituted.

3. In section 22 of the principal Act, in clause (a), for
the words “on the quantity of any excisable article”, the words
the “on the quantity or advalorem of any excisable article”
shall be substituted.

4. In the Schedule appended to the principal Act,-

(i) in column No. (4) against serial No. 2, for the
words “Rupees Fifteen per bulk”, the words “Rupees Fifteen
per bulk or 120% advalorem” shall be substituted;

(ii) In Column No. (4) against serial No. 3, for the
words “Rupees one hundred and twenty per litre of the
strength of proof spirit”, the words “Rupees one hundred
and twenty per litre of the strength of proof spirit or 120%
advalorem” shall be substituted.

5. The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2006 is hereby repealed.

Amend-
ment of
section
17.
Act 17 of
1968.

Amend-
ment of
section
22.

Amend-
ment to
Schedule.

Repeal
of Ordi-
nance 5
of 2006.

T. MADAN MOHAN REDDY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING
AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


J. 679-1
[1]

ACT No. 1 OF 2010.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

No. 5 ]         HYDERABAD, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 31, 2010.

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-30 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS ETC.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature,
received the assent of the Governor on the 29th March,
2010 and the said assent is hereby first published on the
31st  March, 2010 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for
general information.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2       ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY       [Part IV-B

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Excise  (Amendment)  Act, 2010.

   (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force
with effect from 24-05-2005.

2.  In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968,  in
section 20,-

(i) for the word “licensee” wherever it occurs,
the words “licensee/lease holder” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the word “shop”, wherever it occurs, the
words “shop/bar” shall be substituted;

(iii) for sub-section (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely,-

“(3) The licensee/lease holder shall not, on
account of closure of the shop/bar under this section, be
entitled to any  compensation or refund of licence fee or
lease amount”.

3. The Andhra Pradesh Excise (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2010 is hereby repealed.

Amend-
ment of
section 20.
Act  17 of
1968.

Repeal of
Ordi-
nance, 4
of 2010.

Short
title
and
commen-
cement.

R. RAMA CHANDRA  REDDY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING,
AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD, 2010.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


A.692
[1]

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 1-20 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-A  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA PRADESH BILLS

ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

The following Bill was introduced in the Andhra
Pradesh Legislative Assembly on 23rd March, 2010.
.

ACT No. 8 OF 2010.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH EXCISE  ACT, 1968.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty first Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. (1) This Act  may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Excise (Second Amendment)  Act, 2010.

Short
title
and
commen-
cement.

No. 10]       HYDERABAD,  TUESDAY,  MARCH 23,  2010.

Registered No. HSE/49                              [Price : Rs. 0-30 Paise.

     B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$B…{«§æþ{ç³§óþÔŒý Æ>fç³{™èþÐèþ$$
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-B  EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS ETC.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh Legislature,
received the assent of the Governor on the 19th April, 2010
and the said assent is hereby first published on the 20th
April, 2010 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for general
information.

No. 13]          HYDERABAD, TUESDAY, APRIL 20,  2010.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


2        ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY       [Part IV-B

   (2) It shall come into force on such date as the
State Government may, by notification, appoint.

2.  In the Andhra Pradesh Excise Act, 1968,
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 34,
in item (1), in sub-item (ii), for the words “one year”, the
words “three years”, shall be substituted.

3. In section 37 of the principal Act,-

   (1) in item (i), for the words “a term which shall not
be less than one year but which may extend upto three
years”, the words “a term which shall not be less than three
years but which may extend upto five years”, shall be
substituted;

   (2) in item (ii), for the words “a term which shall
not be less than two years but which may extend upto three
years”, the words “a term which shall not be less than three
years but which may extend upto six years”, shall be
substituted.

4. In section 37-A of the principal Act,-

   (1) in sub-section (1), in clause (i), for the words
“two years”, the words “three years”, shall be substituted;

   (2) in sub-section (2), in clause (i), for the words
“two years”, the words “three years”, shall be substituted.

5. In section 60 of the principal Act, for
sub-section (5), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

Amend-
ment of
section
34. Act 17
of 1968.

Amend-
ment of
section
37.

Amend-
ment of
section
37-A.

Amend-
ment of
section
60.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db


April 20, 2010]     ANDHRA  PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY     3

   “(5) Notwithstanding any thing contained in the
Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, no court shall grant any
bail to any person accused of an offence punishable under
sub-item (i) of item (1) of section 34 and to any person
accused of an offence under clause (h) of section 34 or
section 40-A or section  50 or section 50-A of this Act, unless
the prosecuting officer is given an opportunity to oppose
the application and the Court record reasons while granting
the bail.”

6. After section 60 of the principal Act, the following
new section shall be inserted namely,-

    60-A.  The  offences  punishable  under
sub-item  (ii)  of item (1) of  section  34  or
section 37 or section 37-A shall be non-

bailable and the provisions of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973 with respect to non bailable offences shall
apply to those offences.”

Central
Act 2 of
1973.

Insertion
of new
section
60-A.

Non-bailable
Offences.

Central
Act 2 of
1973.

R. RAMA CHANDRA REDDY,
Secretary to Government,

Legislative  Affairs & Justice,
Law Department.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING,
AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD, 2010.

Remove Watermark
Wondershare
PDFelement

http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

	1989AP10.pdf
	1989AP10.pdf
	1994AP4.pdf
	1994AP20.pdf
	1998AP28.pdf
	2000AP11.pdf




