Remove Watermark g

The Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962

Act 9 of 1962

Keyword(s):
Factory, Licence, Occupier, Person, Sugar, Unit

Amendment appended: 27 of 2014, 17 of 2015

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

Wondershare
PDFelement



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Yy

.

mm Wondershare

Remove Watermark g PDFelement

Repheemen’ Series No, LXIV—p. 34.

1962 : Mah, IX] . 6931
THE MAHARASHTRA PURCHASE TAX ON SUGARCANE ACT, 1962. T
. - ;
CONTENTS )
. -—
PREAMBLE, ¢ e :
SECTIONS.
1. Short title and extent. . .
2. * Definitions. | | ?
| 3. Levy of purchase tax. . )
4. ° Taxing and licensing authormes |
5. . Licence for purchasing sugarcane for use in manufacture or production. '
of sugar.
6. Returns.
Assessment and collection of tax. .
TA. Penalty. :
7B. Interest payable by occupier in certain cases. .
“Appeal.. | ' ’
9.  Revision. _ )
- 10. - Courtsfees. . ' :
11.  Application of sections 4 and 12 of Limitation Act. : - _ o
. 12.  Finality of assessment and penalty and recovery of unpaid fax and penaity.
12A.  Special mode of recovery. . .
12B. Remission of tax. | e TS
13.  Service of notice. ] ' ;
14. Power to inspect and take copies of records and accounts. « o 4
15. Information acquired to be treated confidential. T . | j
15A. Publication and disclosure of information respecting occuplers of factoy, : ’
ries and units and other persons in public interest. , o
16.  Offences and penalty. ' . .._ . ..
17.  Offences by Companies. | | . . o %
. 17A. Compounding of offences. | . o i;
18.  Rules. : . . 4
19.  Certain purchases not to be liable to tax. . . ) j
20. Repeal of Mah. Ord. No, Vof 1961, & . -
. .
. [ ] * o [d . y * .
. .
- . . .



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare

Remove Watermark g PDFelement

Replacement (Series No. LXII—p. 53

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. IX OF 1962!

[THE MAHARASHTRA PURCHASE TAX ON SUGARCANE ACT, 196_2] ' ..
S ' [18th April 1962 -
Amended by Mah. 9 of 1965. , . ¢ . e
v . s 4901974 (17-9-1974)*
o . . 600f1974 1 (4-11-1974)*
1 ” iL] 6.2 Of !975 (22‘12‘1975)‘ )
» » o 34 of 1976 (11-10-1976)* .
An Act to provide for the levy and collection of a tax om the purchase of .
siigarcane for use in *[the manufactare or production of sagar . !

(including khandsari sugar) ].

» .
WHEREAS, itis exp:adient to provide for the levy and collection of a tax
on the purchase of sugarcane for use in 2[the manufacture or  production of
sugar (including khandsari sugar),} and for matters connected with the purposes
aforesaid ; It is hereby enacted in the Thirtesnth Year of the Republic of India
as follows 1 —
1. '(J) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Puarchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, Short title

1962, . and extent.
(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Maharashtra. '
2. 1In this Act, unless the context otherwiss requires,— Definitionse

(q) * Commissioner » means the Commissioner of Purchase Tax (Sugarcans)
appainted under this Act ; « ,

(b) * factory ** means any premises (including the precincts thereof), wherein

. twenty or more workers are working and in which, or in-any part of whick, any
manufacturing process corngcted with the production of sugar by means of vacuum R
pans is bsing carried on, or is ordinarily carried on, with the aid of power ; .

(c) * licence ” means a licence granted or renewed under this Act ;

(d) 3{* occupier ™ of a factory or of a unit} means the psrson who has vltimate
control over the 4[affairs of the factory or the unit] and where the said
affairs are entrusted to a managing agent, such agent shall be S[desmed to be
the occupier of the factory or of the unit, as the case may he ;] and the term L
includes also any parson appointed by the occupier to act asa purchasing agent; .

(e) * person * includes any company or association or body of individuals, :
whether incorporated or not, and also a Hindu undivided family, a firm and a
local authority ;

(f) * prescribed > means prescribed by rules made under this Act; - .

*[(g) “ Sugar ” includes * khandsari sugar ”, and “ sugar * and ** khandsari
sugar ~ shall have the meanings assigned to them in the First Schedufe to the .
Central Excises and Salt Act, 1944 ;] ' : _

7[(4) * unit > mcans. a unit engaged or ordinarily engaged in the manufacrure ) ';
or production of khandsari sugar and which is capable of handling or processing SR
sugarcane juice produced with the a'd of a crusher’driven by power.]. .

—_— ) e . .
1 F<l)§ Statement of Objects and Rewsoas see Mazharashtra Governinent Gazette, 1962, Part V, *
a . . . L J .

P 'g?l'hf:se woids and brakeets ware substituted for ths words ** the manufacture of sugar * by Mah,

60 of 1974, ss. 2 & 3. )
3 Thase words were substituted for the words ** ogcupier of -« factory ', ibid., s. 4(a). R

¢ These words were substituted for the words “ affairs of a lactory ™" ibid. s '
* Thase words were substituted for the words * deemed to be occupier of the factory ; ™, ifd.

¢ Clause (g) was- substitated, ibid., s. 4(h). :

7 Clause (h) was added, ibid., s. 4(c). _ . * .
* This indicates the date of commencement of Act. : :

+ Maharashtra Ordinance No. XXI of 1974 was repealed by Muh. 60° of 1974, s. 13. -



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Wondershare
Remove Watermark .- PDFelement

6934 Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane %Act, 1962  [1962 : Mah. IX

Levyof 3. () There slgal be levied and collected a tax 6n the purchase of sugarcane,
purghase such sugarcane bein purchased for the purpose of the use thereof in the Imanu- -
o . '™ facture or production of sugar in a factory or a unit,) °

2[(2) The tax under sub-section (1) shall be levied at such rate per kilogram of ¢
sugarcane purchased for the purpose aforesaid, as may be specified by the State .
s + Government by notification in the Official Gazette, and different rates may be -
specified for sugarcane purchased for the manufacture or production of .sugar in
a factory and for the manufacture or production of khandsari sugar in a unit.
3[“ Different rates may also be specified for sugarcane purchased for the manufac- )
ture or production of khandsari sugar in units situated in areas, which are declared .
by the State Government, from time to time, by notification in the Officiaé Gazette, ‘
. as developed areas and undeveloped areas, respectively.] But in no case, the rate
or rates so specified shall exceed two paise per kilogram of sugarcane so purchased.] .

(3) For the purpose of the levy of the tax as aforesaid, there shall be leducted
+ from the gross weight of sugarcane so purchased, such proportion thereof representing
' the average weight of the tops of the sugarcane plant consisting of pith devoid
o of any sugar content and leaves and other thrash usnally present in sugarcane, as
may be prescribed; and the tax shall be levied only on the remaining weight of the
sugarcane after such|deduction has been made. :

(#) The tax levied under the foregoing sub-sections $hall be paid by the occupier
of the factory *[or of the unit, as the case may be,] at such intervals and in such
manner, as is hereinafter provided. i

Taingand 4, (1) For carrying into effect the provisions of this Act, the State Government
Jm""&“ shall appoint%n officer to be called the Commissioner of Purchase Tax (Sugarcane) ;
"and may appoint one or more officers to assist such Commissioner in the perfor-

mance of his functions under this Act, and give them such designations as may be

prescribed. ‘
. (2) Subject to any conditions and restrictions hich the State Government
may by general or ial order impose, the officers so appointed shall, within

their jurisdiction, exercise such of the powers and perform such of the duties of

the Commissiorer under this Act, as the Commissioner may by order in writing

delegate to them either generally, or as respects any particular matter or class of
. matters. .

> © Licencgfor 5, (I) Except under and in accordance with the conditions of a licence issued
purchasisg by the Commissioner, [no person shall purchase any sugarcane for the. purpose
&"m of the use thereof in the manufacture or production of sugar in a factory or a unit:

manufacture _ Provided that, any person who is an occupier of a unit on the date of commence-
. tio:igfr:gsu:-r ment of the Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane (Second Amendment) Act; Mah.

~ 1974, may obtain such licence, within a period of thirty days from the said date] LXof

(2) An application for a licence shall be in such form, and made in such manner,
and shall be accompanied by such fee, 7[not exceeding five rupees,] as may be pres-
cribed. R _ ,

. (3)" Subject to the other provisions of the section, the Commissioner shall, after
.. due verification of any application received for a licence, issue the licence ;

1 These(words were substituted for the werds “ manufacture of sugarin a factory:” by Mabh. 60 of
1964, s. 5(a). ;
s o ® Sub-section (2) was substituted, ifid., s. 5(4).
* o ° These words were in by Mah. 34 1976, s. 2. . .
¢ These words were inserted by Mah. 60 of 1964 5. 5(c). - N
. * These words were substituted for the words * in the manufacture » ibid. 6(b). . -
% This poftion was substitutgd for the portion beginning with ** no person shall >’ and ending with .
“in a factory ” ibid., s. 6(a). : .
*These words were inserted by Mah. 9 of 1965, s. 2. S



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark .-

'Replacement Series No. LXIM—p. 54 _
1962 : Mah. IX] Maharashira Purchase Tax on Sugarccne

Provided that, the Commissioner may, after giving the applicant a reasonable
opportunity of being heard, refuse to issue a licence (o any person if the Commis-
sioner has already cancelled, or refused to renew, a licence previously granted to
such person. . _ :

(4) A licence issued under this section shall be subject to such conditions as may
be prescribed and shall be valid up to and inclusive of the  30th day of June next
following, and shall subject to the other provisions of this section [and on payment
of such fee, not exceeding two ruppes, as may be pre~cribed] be renewable in the

escribed manner. _

(5) If a licensee commits a breach of any of the conditions of his licence, the
Commissioner may, after giving him a reasonable opportunity of being heard, cancel
or refuse to remew his licence. : ,

(6) Any person aggrieved by an order of the Commissioner cancelling, or refusing
to issue or renew any licence, may within three months from the date of such order
appeal tothe State Government, who may confirm, modify or rescind such order.

6. (I) Every occupier liable to pay tax under this Act shall, within thirty days
after the end of every month to which the return relates, submit a return in the
prescribed form to the Commissioner. Every such return shall show in kilogramms
the total quantity of sugarcane purchased by him for use 2fin the manufacture or
production of sugar in a factory or unit, as the case may be,] d ring the preccding
month, together with such further informartion as may be prescribed.

Wondershare

PDFelement

Retutns.

(2) Every return shall be accompanied by a receipt for payment on ngernment‘

aceount into a Government Treasury or the Reserve Bank of India of the full amount
of tax leviable under section 3 for the period to which the return relates.

(3) Every return shall be verified in the manner prescribed. .
- 3[(4) Where a return is. submiited to the Commissioner without making payinent

of the full amount of tax leviable under section 3, the full amount or the remaining

amount due, as the case may be, shall be paid by the occupier on Gcwrnment

account into a Government dreasury of the Reserve Baok of India by such date

as'may be specified in a notice served by the Commissioner for this purpose, being

a date not earlier than ten days of the service of the notice, and the receipt for svch

payment shall be forwarded by him to the Commissioner within sevengays from such
[ ]

specified date.]

7. ({) On receipt of a return under section 6, the Commissioner shall assess
the tax payable in respect of the period to which the return relates and if the amount
has not aiready bee¢n paid as aforesaid, he sball cause a notice to be served upon
the person corcerned requiring him to pay the amount assessed, within ten days
of the service of the notice. :

Assessment n\

and -
Collegtion of
ta%

(@) If the occupier fails to submit in due time the return referred to in section '

6, the Commissioner shall after giving him a rea sonable opportunity of being heard

assess to the best of his judgment the amount of tax payable and the provisions of

sub-section (1) in respect of notice shall apply as if such assessment has been made

on tt‘le basis of a return furnishe:l by such pex:fon. . .
® - *

.

5{ 7A. (D) If an occupier, without reasonable cause, fails to submit the réturn
as required by sub-section (I) of section 6, the Commissioner may, *after giving
him a reasonable opportunity of being heard, by an order in writing, impos@upon
him by way of penalty, in addition to the amount of tax and interest, a sum not
exceeding twice the amount of tax assessed under section 7.

T These words were inserted by Mah. 9 of 1965,s.2. - = . v

¢ These words were substituted for the words ** in the man ufacture of sugar in a factory " by Mah.
60 of 1974, s. 7. : :

3 Sub section (4) was added by Mah. 34 of 1976, s. 3. . e

¢ Sub-section (3} was deleted by Mah. 49 of 1974, s. 2.

s Section 7A was substituted by Mah. 34 of 1976, s. 4. L] . .

Pﬂn:lty. .


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

« (2) If an cccupier

he is required by or

may, after giving h

. writing, impose upon

interest, & sum equal to—

(@)sone and one

the tax ; and
(b) two per cent.
. time he continues

(3) The amount of

* 6936  Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane

the first three months,

does not, without reasonable cause, pay tax within the time
under the provisions of this Act to pay it, the Commissioner
m a reasonable opportunity of being heard, by an- order in
him by way of penalty, in addition to the amourt of tax and

half per cent. of the amount of tax due for each month for

after the last day by which the occupier should have paid

of the amount of tax due for each month thereafter during the

to make default in the payment of tax..

any penalty imposed under this section shall be paid by the

. occupier into a Government Treasury or the Reserve Bank of India witkin ten days

Qf the service of a nof

ice by the Commissioner for this purpose.

(4) The Commissioner or any appellate or revisional avthority may, fon reasons

to be recorded, remit

the whole or any part of the penalty payzble by any occupier

in respact of any period.

(5) No prosecution
of the same facts on

Interest 7B, (I) If an oc
payable by (1) of sectign 6 or to
occupler
incertain

for an offence under this Act shall be instituted in respect
vhich a penalty has been imposed under this section].

cupier fails to submit the return as required by sub-section
pay the full amount of tax as required by sub-section (2) of

that section, he shall, in addition to the tax and the penalty (if any), pay simple

cases. interest on the amount due at the rate of one and one half per cent of the amount

. for each month from
the return under sub-
to make default in th

Explanation—For

the date immediately following the last day for submission of
section (1) of section 6 during the time the occupier continues
e payment of the amount due.

the purposes of this sub-section, where an occupier fails to

submiit the return in

* of section 7 shall be
* sub-section (2) of

(2) If an occupier

of section 7, or #he a

due time, the amount of tax assessed under sub-section (2)

ction 6. :
ails to pay the amount of tax assessed under sub-section 10))

%i:emed to be the amount of tax due from the occupier under

ount of penalty imposed under

section 7A, by thie date spec-

fied fn the notice served upon him by the Commissioner for the purpose, he shall

. pay simplg interest on the amount of tax
» half per cent. for each month from the

or penalty due at the rate of one and one
date immediately following the date speci-

Wondershare
PDFelement

« fied in the notice during the time the occupier continues to make default in the payment
- * of the amount due,
(3) The Commissioner or any appellate or revisional authority may, for reasons
to be recorded, remit the whole or any part of interest payable by any occcupier
. ir? respect of any period.]

8. Any person aggrieved by an order or assessment made *[under section 7,
or penalty imposed udder section 7A, 3[or by any interest charged under section
7B,] may, within three months from the date of communication of the order,]
*[or, as the case may be, from the date of charging the interest,] apply-to the pres-
cribed gppellate authority - for the annulment or modification of the assessment or

®  Appeal,

. penalty *[or*interest] and, on such application,
& may, sabject to such rules of procedure as may

"~ annul or modify the assessment or penaity

. such person of the whale or part, as the case

the prescribed appellate authority
be made in this behalf, confirm,

5lor interest] and order the refund to

may be, of any amount paid.

* . - 1Section 7B was inser;jg
1

2 This portion was su

by Mah. 34 of 1976, s. 3. : .
tuted for the words ** or penalty levied under section: 7 may, within

three months from the date of the ordet,” by Mah. 49 of 1974, s, 4.

s 3 These
* These words were in
8 These words were in

words were inseged. by Mah. 34 of 1976, s. 6.(a).

rted, ibid, s. 6. (b). o .
, ibl, 5. 6. (¢). ‘ o



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Y
Wondershare

Remove Wat
atermark PDFelement

Replacementy Series No. LXIII—p. 55
1962 : Mah. IX] Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962 H936 A

1[9. (1) Subject to such rules as may be made in this behalf and for reasons to be Revision.
« recorded in writing, the Commissioner, or any other prescribed revisional authority, -

. may, upon an application or of his or its own motion, revise any order (including "
« - an order in appeal) made under this Act or any rules made thereunder, by any officer :
appointed to assist the Commissioner : , _ ‘

: [
Provided that, no application under this sub-section shall be entertained if it is
" not made within a period of four months from the date of communication of the
Mah, order, but any order made before the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
XLIX Purchase Tax on Sugarcane (Amendment) Act, 1974, may be revised by the revisional * =
of authority «of its own motion in favour of any occupier of a factory within a period
1974. of one year from the date of such commencement, although the original period of .
_ Iimitation therefor may have expired earlier ; and any order made on or after the,
date of spch commeéncement may be revised by the revisional authority on its own
motion, only if a notice therefor is served on the occupier within a period of three
years from the date of communication of the order and the order in revision is mad®  *
within a period of five years from the date of such communication :

Provided further that, before rejecting any application for revisioﬂ, the revisional
authority shall record the reasons for such rejection. '

. - L J

(2) Before any order is passed under this section, which is likely to affect any
person adversely, such person shall be given a reasonable opportunity of being heard.

(3 Where a person could have appealed under section 8 and no appeal has been
filed by him, no proceedings in revision under this section shall be entertained upon
the application of such person]

Bom. 10, Notwithstanding anything contained in the Bombay Court-fees, 1959, an Court-fees.

xx%,‘i appeal preferred under section 8, and an application for revision made under section

of 9, shall bear a court-fee stamp of such value 2[not exceeding five fupees,] as may
1959. be.prescribed. -

11. In computing the period laid down in sections 8 and 9, the provisions of Application " 4

IXof sections 4and 12 of the Indian Limitation Act, 1908 shall, so far as may be, apply. :{fﬂs&ttigm c;if -
1908. ' ‘ o Limitation

- . o : Act.” :

12. (1) An assessment made in accordance with the provision of section 7 $[and qFinality of o -

penalty imposed under section 7A] 4[or any interest charged under section 7B} assessment .-

shall, subject to sections 8 and 9, be final, and shall not be called in question in any X mdimu :

‘o nteres
civil court. ) and recovery-
: of unpaid .-

(2) Any tax or penalty ®for interest] recoverable under this Act and remaéning Ptagxnah,y] 1:‘,;?;‘ ,
unpaid may be recovered as an arrear of land revenue. . _ .. " intesest] ., -

1 Section. 9 was substituted for the original, by Mah. 49 of 1974 &, 5. ,

2 These words were ifiserted by Mah. 9 of 1965, s. 3. _ ) o &

s This portion was inserted by Mah. 49 of 1974, o, 6(a). e e o
¢  These words were inserted by Mah. 34 of 1976, 8. %a). . R

' & These words were inserted, ibid., s. T(b). ' .
. -« This matginal notg was substituted by Mah. 49 of 1974, s, 6(b). )
. 7 The words * and interest * were substituted by Mah. 340f 1978,s. (. ..



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

: Wondershare
. PDFelement

* 6936B

Speciale  '[12A.  Notwithstanding anything contained in any law or contract to the
mqgle of contrary, the Commissioner may, at any time or from time to time, by notice in
recovery. writing (a copy of which shall be forwarded to the occupier of the factory at his last
o address known to the Commissioner), require— ‘

- (a)eany person from whom any amount of money is due, or may become due, *

. to the *[occupier of|the factory orthe unit] on whom notice has been served under
~ 3[section 7 or 7A, |or from whom interest is due under section 7B, or].

. (b) any person who holds or may subsequently hold money for or on account
of such Z[occupier| of the factory or the unit], :
. to pay to the Commissioner, either forthwith upon the money becoming due or
' being held or at or within the time specified in the notice (but not béfore the money *
_ becomes due or is held as aforesaid), so much of the money as is sufficient te pay the
. amount due by the 3[occupier of the factory or the unit] in respect of the arrears of

4{tax, penalty and interest] payable under this Act, or the whole of the money when it
is equal to or less than that amount.’ - '

Explanation—For | the purposes of this section, the amount of money due to
the 2[occupier of the factory or the unit] from, or money held for or on account of the
#[occupier gf the factory or the unit] by, any person shall be calculated after deducting
therefrom such claims (if any) lawfully subsisting, as may have fallen du¢ for payment
by such occupier of] the factory to such person.

~"The Commissione may, at any time or from time to time, amend or revoke any
such notice, or extend the time for making any payment in pursuance of the notice.

Any person making any payment in compliance with a notice under this section
. shall be deemed to have made the payment under the authority of the 2[occupier of
+  the factory or the unit], and the receipt of the Commissioner shall constitute a good

and suﬂicieqt discharge of the liability of such person, to the extent of the amount
referred to m.the eceipt.

Any person discharging any iiability to the *[occupier of the factory or the unit] -
* after receipt of the notice referred to in this section, shall be personally liable to the R
Commissioner to the extent of the liability discharged, or the extent of the liability of

o - the *[occupier of the | factory or the unit] for #[tax, penaltyand interest] whicheveris
less. :

. o Where any person to whom a notice under this section is sent provesto the satisfac-
tion of the Commissipner that the sum demanded or any part thereof is not due to the
*[occupier of the factory or the unit], or that he does  not hold any money for or on
account of the 2[occupier of the factory or the unit), then nothing contained in this
section shall be deemed to require such person to pay any sum or part thereof, as
the case may be, to the Compmissioner.

*

Ady'ameunt of money which a person is required to pay to the Commissioner,
e or fgr which he is perconally liable to the Commissioner under this section, shall, . o
if it remains unp:id, be recovejable as an arrear of land revenue. ' '

. 1 Sections 124 and 12B were inserted, by Mak. 49 of 1974 5. 7. .
) * % These words were substituted for the words ** occupier of thg factory ** by Mah. 60 of 1974, s.12. . .
* % Thesg, words were substituted., by Mah' 34 of 1976 ibid.; s. 8(a). -
. 4 These words were substituted, ibid., s. 8(b). _ .. ' .
-#¢ These words were inserted# ibid., s. 7(c). * . L
) .
. .
. . ‘e * . .
L L4 - .
- . ’ . . 5
® » Fy - ‘



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Mah.

Remove Watermark @ Wondershare

H  PDFelement

Replacementd Series No. LXIIJ—p. 56
1962 : Mab. IX] - Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962 6936B1

12B. For the parpose of encouraging the [establishment of new factories’ of Remission
units, or for the parpass of ovarcoming any difficulties in respect of any factories of tas.
or units in the initial psriods of manufaciure or production of sugar,] the State Govern- _ .
ment may, by notification in the Official Gazette, remit the whole or any part of the *
tax payable by or unde; this Act, for suc peiiod or pariods lincluding any period or =
periods which commenced bzfore the date of commencement of the Mah®rashtra ,

xLIX Purchase Tax on Sugarcane {Amendment) Act, 1974] and subject to such condit:ons

1_9731” (if any), as it may spacify in such naotification.]

13 A notice under the provisions of this Act may be served by post, ¢r by Service  of
delivering it or tendering it to the person to whom it is addressed or his agent, ov in notice.
such other manner as is prescribed. : A

14 () The Commissioner or other person authorised by him in this- beahlt’, Power to

copies

" shall have accass at all reasonable times to *[any factory, unit or place of business] itni];wt and
L 4

g : a
of any person liable to pay tax under this Act. | &F records
, . . . . . and accounts.

(2) The Commissioner or the parson authorised as aforesaid may at any time,
with o- without notice to such parson, examine his working records and accounts,
and take cop‘es of or extracts from any of the said records of accounts for purposes
of testing the accuracy of-any reiurn of for informing himself as to the particulars
regarding which information is reguaired for the purposes of this Act or angrules made
thereunder.

' (3) Where the Commissionar or prson authorised proposes to examine under .
sub-ssction (2) any record or account coataining the description or fosmulae of any
trade procsss, ths parson liable to pay tax may giva fo the said authority, for transmis-
sion to the State G ova:nment, a written notic of objection, and thereupon that autho-
rity shall ssalup the racord or acsount pariing the orders of the State Government.
L4 L]

15. (1) All such copies and extracts and all information acquired by the Com- Iaformation
mission3r or paraon aathorisad as aforesaid from an irspsciion of any cuch factory acquired - to
3[unit] oc place of business or from any return submitted under this Act, shall be be d“'e?‘fd
treated as confidential. : . confidential.

(2) If, savaas p-ovided in s 1b szction (3), the ‘Commissioner or the persdh authoris-

" ed a; aforesaid disclosss to aty oths: pson any infor mation which is required to be . .

traated as confileatial, hs shall, on conviction, bz pinished with imprisonment for , *

a term wh'ch may exieni to six moaths, o7 with fine, or with both.
y

(3) N>thing in th's sagtion shall adply to the disclosure cf such informationgin -
respast of tha making of a false return under this Act. -
1 These words were substituted for th2 words ** establishmznt of new factories ; or for the purpose *
of overcoming any difficultics in respzot of any factories in the initial periods of manufacture of
sugar by Mah, 60 of 1974s.9 .
1 These words were substituted for the wards “ any factomy or place of business ”* ibid., s. 10.
* This word was inserted ibid., s. 11, L ’
.‘ . L ] .
i} [ ] L)
.
. *
. L ]
. . .
L ]
L} . ) .
L J
L
(]
[ - [ ]
¢ L ] bd . ° L ]
L] L ]
L ‘ ®
- [ ]



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

1o publish or disclose the names of any occupiers of factories or units or other 317¢ ofe
" persons and any other particulars relating to any proceedings under this Act respgetiag -

- appropnmiate appellate authority has expired without an appeal having been presented

‘the case may be, may also be published or disclosed, if, in the opinion of the

- shall, on conviction, be punished with simple imprisonment for a term which may

mm Wondershare
Remove Watermark g PDFelement

Replacemelit Series No. LXI—p. 67. : :
1962 : Mah. IX} Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962  6936C

1§15 A. (/) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 15, if the State l’u;\ﬁcation
Government is of opinion that it is necessary or expedient in the public interest and disclo-

information

in respect of such occupiers and persons, it may publish or disclose - @r cause occupiers

to be published or disclosed’such names and particulars in such manner as it thinks of 3%@:45
and units

fit. : and other -

persons in

public

interest,

(2) Nb publication or disclosure under this section shall be made in relation
to any tax levied or penalty imposed or any conviction for any offence connected
with any proceedings under this Act, until the time for presenting an appeal to tht

or the appeal, if presented, has been disposed of. e .

Explanation.—In the case of a firm, company or other association of persons, - .
the names of the partners of the firm, the directors, managing agents, secretaries,
treasurers or managers of the company, or the members of the association, as -

State Government, the circums;ances of the case justify it.] - .
2(16. (I) Whoever—- ‘ : d ' Offencefand
(a) purchases sugarcane for use in the 3 manufacture or production of sugar penaity.
in a factory or a unit] without obtaining a licence, or '
(b) fails, without sufficient cause, to furnish any return as required by section 6,
by the date and in the manner prescribed, or knowingly furnishes a false return. .

extend to six months, or with fine which may extend to two thoysand rupees, or
with both. : .

(2) No prosecution for an offence against this Act shall be instituted in respect
of the same facts on which a penalty has been imposed by the Commissioner under.
the provisions of this Act.] .

17. (1) Where an offence under the last preceding section has been committed Oﬂ'ence?;. by. *
by a company, every person who, at the time the offence was committed, was in companies. '
charge of, or was responsible to, the company for the conduct, of the business of the .
company, as well as the company, shall be deemed to be guilty of the offence and
shall be liable:to be proceeded against and punished accordingly : :

. X . 5

Provided that, nothing contained in this sub-section shall render any, sucheperson o o
liable to any punishment under that section if he proves that the offence was :
committed without his knowledge and that he exercised all due diligence to Brevent

the commission of such offence. . 2

. .
. °
1 Section 15A was inscrted by Mah. 62 of 1975, 5. 3. . o * *
s Section 16 was substituted for the original by Mah. 49 of 1974, s#8. -~ *
3 These words wer® substituted’for the words “ manufacture ®©f sugar in a factory " by Man.60
of 1974, s. 12 : . ' .
. ‘ .
™
. . * .
- [ 2 . [ ]



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark g

6936D Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugercane iAct, 1962 {!962 : Mah. IX

« * (2) Notwithstanding ‘anything contained in sub-section (/), where an offence

. under the last preceding section has been comritted by a company and it is,

. proved that the offence has been committed with the consent or connivance of,
or is attributable to, any neglect on the part of, any director, manager, secretary

- o or other officer of the company, such director, manager, secretary or other officer

e o+  shall #8so be deemed to be guilty of that offence and shall be liable to be proceeded
against and punished accordingty: : _
Explanation.~—For the purposes of the section—

. (a) ““ company " means any body corporate, and includes a firm or other,
association of individuals, and . -

. (b) ** director *} in relation to a firm, means a partner in the firm.

Compound- 17A. (1) The Commissioner may, either before or after the instiution of
ing o . . .
offences *Proceedings for. any offence punishable under section 16, or under any rules
~ made under this Act, accept from any person charged with such offence by way
- of composition of the offence. a sum not exceeding two thousand rupees or
double the amount of tax which would have been payable on the purchases to

which the said offence relates, whichever is greater :

Providc.d thét, where the offence relates only to a breach of any rules the sum
for whiqh the offence may be compounded shall not exceed two thousand rupees.

o (2) On payment of such sum as may be determined by the Commissioner under
' sub-section (/) no further proceedings shall be taken against the accused person
in respect &f the same offence.] -

1 Section 17A was inserted by Mah. 49 of 1974,s. 9.
. ; L ]
.
*
-
L ] M *
e
- [ 4
L ]
N,
. . L3
L
. L ]
LN ] . . .
[ .
o .
* .
. L ]
* [ ]
- . [} .
. »
; [
[ ]
L . P
‘ L] . L ] ® ‘ . ‘ . ) . ]
. ’ i i ) : )
e . e o | ;' |

mm Wondershare
PDFelement



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

' . D ' SRR
- ’ mm Wondershare
- ] o Remove Watermark g PDFelement

Replacemest Series No. LXII—p. 57
. 1962 : Mah. XX}  Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962 6937

. 18, - (1) The State Government may make rules for carryinginto effect the purposes Rufes.
o« of this Act. o A T e

. (2) In particular and without prejudice to the generality of the foregoing power, :
. such rules may provide for all or any of the following matters, namely :(— -

(a) under section 3, the proportion of the gross weight of sugarcane for the -
purposes of deduction under sub-section (3) of that section ;

: (b) under section 4, the designations of officers appointed - to assist the Com-
. o missioner ; . :

© under section 5, the form and manner in which an application for a licence .
. shall be made, Yconditions of licence, manner of its renewal, fees to b paid for
| a liee:nce and for renewal thereof ;] '

. (d) under section 6, the form in which accounts and records shall be maine .
tained and returns shall be submitted, further information to be furnished with .
. " the return, and the manner in which the tax shall be paid and returns verified . .
" 2[and the form of notice to be served under that section]; .

{¢) under section 7, the form of notice to be served under that section and
the procedure to be followed for assessment and collection of the asse.ssed dues ;

(f) under section 8, the appellate authority to which an appzal ?&?mnulmant
or modification of assessment or penalty 3[or interest] may be made and the proce-
dure for, and other matters incidental to, the disposal of anpeals ; e

L
(g) under section 9, the revisional authority other than the Commissioner and
procedure for, and other matters incidental to, the disposal of applications for
revision ; -

- (#) under section 10, the value of court-fee stamp on an appzai and appli-
cation for revision ; '

(i) under section 12, the procedure for recovery of unpaid 4[tax, pznalty and
interest} as an arrear of land revenue ; .

. (j) under section 13, the other manner in which a notice may be sewed ; .

(k) under section 14, the procedure for inspzction and taking copies of record
and accounts ; _ : .

(D) any other matter, which is required to be or may be prescribed.

. (3) In making any rules, the State Government may direct that a breach theredY * .
: ghall, on conviction, be punished with fine not exceeding one thousand rupzes.

(4) Rules made under this section shall be subject to the sondition of previous
pudlication. : ‘

{5) All rules made under this section shall bz laid for not less than thigty tays
before each House of the State Legislature as soon as possible after they are’'made -® = s »
and shall be subject to such modifications as the Legislature may make durigg the o = T
sessions in which they ate so laid or the session immediately following and publish :
in the Official Gazette.

. [ .

. N > e *

- . 1 These words were substituted for the words * the fees to be paid, the conditions of licenceand
- manner of its renewal ; ** by Mah. 9 of 1965, s, 4. . -

: . 3 These words were inserted by Mah. 34 of 1976, 5. 9(a). . .
. . ® These words wers inserted, Hid., s. 3(b). . .

® .,  * These words were substituted, ibid., s. 9(c). . . .
- [
- [ ]
L] .'
[ * . [ ] b4 . ° [ ]


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark .- EIE T

PDFelement

6938 Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962 [1962 : Mah.TX

‘m,-;, 19. Nothing in this Act or the rules made thereunder shall be deemed to .
purchases impose or authorlizr the imposition of a tax on the purchase of sugarcane where

. to e o. . .

liable to tax Such purchases take place | : .
.o - (a) (i) outside #he State, or . ‘ .
. - (i} in the course of the import of the goods into the territory of India, or

the export thereof out of such territory, or

(b) in the course of inter-State trade or comnieroc ;

and the provisions |of this Act and the said rules shall be read and construed .
accordingly. | : .

. Explanaﬁon.——FoA‘ the purposes-of this section, whether a purchase takes place— *
() outside the State, or .

(ii) in the course of the import of the goods into the territory of India, or
export thereof out of such territory, or ‘

(ifi) in the cm}se of inter-State trade or commerce,

shall be determined in accordance with the principles specified in sections 3, 4 Lx-
and 5 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956. : XIVof

. 1956.

Repeal of 20. (7) The Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Ordinance, 1961 is hereby Mah
Mah. Ord, repealed ah.
Ne. V of : : ord.
)] Notwithstandi g such repeal, anything done or action taken (including any 1961,
appointments macl!:':f notifications, rules, orders, returns, notices, licences issued,
given, refused or made, assessments made, taxes paid, applications given, appeals
.. preferred) under the Ordinance so repealed, shall be deemed to have been done

or taken by or under this Act, as if this Act were in" force on the date on which
such thing was done or action was taken.

' .
LN ) e L]
[ ®
g .
- . . -
LJ -
-
L] . -
’ . N
- - 'S
- o ’ . he ™
- s L ] -
L
[ ]
. .
. . ‘s . -



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark g

Reg. No. MIMR/South-344/2014-16

ATARUT HTT A3

ad &, IF 3(3)] AR, FA RE, 0[F/HWE 4, TH 2338 [g =, fwe :vm@ R9.00

STHTYIRYUT HATE Wk

U e n i E e
e framheew afufmm @ veae venfua e SRy @ Gee fataw st
fadi @~ favmTag aetel frdad (Fut arEm).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation) Act, 2014
(Mah. Act No. XXVII of 2014), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

H. B. PATEL,
Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXVII OF 2014.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 26th June 2014),

An Act further to amend certain tax laws in operation in the State of
Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend certain tax laws in operation
1n the State of Maharashtra, for the purposes heréinafter appearing; it 1s
hereby enacted in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY.
1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Short title and
Amendment and Validation) Act, 2014. commencement
(®

g AE-9R—2

mm Wondershare
PDFelement


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare

? LR Ce i G B oI R CELRE e LirY  Remove Watermark . @™ - ppFejement

(_2) Sg,ctiéns 2, 7_,"9 and 15 shall come into force with effect from the 1st
July 2014 and remaining sections shall come into force on the date of
publication of this Act in the Official Gazette.
CHAPTER II
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA STAMP ACT.
Amendment 2. In SCHEDULE L appended,-to the. Maharashtra Stamp Act, in LX of

of . 1958.
SCHEDULE article 6, |
I of LX of (1) in clause (1), in sub-clause (b.), in colpmn (2), for the words and
1958. figures “Two rupees Tor evef'y"i'upees 1,000 or’part thereof for the amount

secured by such deed.” the words and figures “Two rupees. for every.
rupees 1000 or part thereof for the amount secured by such deed, subject.
to ‘the maxunum of ten lakh rupees.” shall be substituted; .

(2) Tn clause (2), in sub-clause (b) in column (2), for the words and ‘
figures “Two rupees for every rupees 1,000 or part thereof for the amount
secured by such deed.” the words and figures “Two rupees for every
rupees 1000 or part thereof, for the amount secured by such deed subject
to the mgximum of ten lakh rupees.” shall be substituted. .

- . em . .

' CHAPTER I1I
AMENDMENTS, TO THE MAHARASHTRA PURCHASE TAX ON SUGARCANE AcT, 1962.

Insertion of 3.  After section 12A of the Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Mah.IX
section 12AA Act, 1962 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referrad to as “the Purchase Tax on of 1962.

in Mah. 1%(63 Sugarcane Act”), the following section shall be inserted,

namely :—
Special “12AA. Subject to the provisions of this Act and the rules made
Pf}:ve?S of thereunder, the provisions of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, Mah.
un?i‘::r Zﬁt}zi 2002 and the rules made thereunder so far as they relate to the recovery ;X 5°f
recovery of of tax as arrears of land revenue, shall mutatis mutandis apply for the 00
tax as purposes of recovery of tax under this Act. The authorities appointed )
arrea{s 05 under this Act shall have and exercise all the powers and perform all
revena;le the duties of the equivalent authorities appointed under the Maharashtra Mah. IX
' Value Added Tax.Act, 2002.”. . . of 2005.
Amendment 4. In section 12B of the Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, after clause
12]3f Seltf}::a(iln (d), the following clause shall be added, namely :—
IX ::;1962 “(e) for the purpose of assisting the sugar factories in the State, to give
the fair and remunerative price to the farmers for the year 2013-14.”. i’
CHAPTER IV i
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA STATE TAX ON PROFESSIONS, TRADES, ‘CALLINGS AND
EmMpLOYMENTS AcT, 1975.
Amendment 5. In section 6 of the Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Trades, Mah.

"ffﬁ‘;‘g’g{%ﬁ Callings and Employments Act, 1975 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred XVI of
© of 1975, to as “the Profession Tax Act”), to sub-section (3), the following proviso shall 1975.

be added, namely :—
“Provided that, if the State Government is satisfied that it is
necessary so to do in the public interest, it may, from time to time, by
notification published in the Official Gazette, exempt the whole or any


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare
®  PDFelement

Remove Watermark

Mah.

TERTE, IR THYT FTATYWRIT | ATE. {F I\, 0%/

part of the late fee payable under this sub-section, by such'class or classes
of employers, for such period or periods, either prospectively or
retrospectively, as may be specified in such notification.”.

6. In section 27A of the Profession Tax Act, for clause (e), the following

clause shall be substituted, namely :—

“(e) Any person with Intellectual and Development Disabilities
(Mental Retardation) specified in the rules made in this behalf, which is
certified by a psychiatrist working in a Government Hospital and which
has the effect of reducing considerably such individual’s capacity for
normal work or engaging in a gainful employment or occupation and
parents or guardian of such person :

Provided that, such individual or, as the case may be, employer
produces the aforesaid certificate before the prescribed authority in
respect of the first assessment year for which he claims deduction under
this clause.

Explanation.— For the purpose of this clause, the expression
“Government Hospital” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause (¢);”.

7. In SCHEDULE I appended to the Profession Tax Act, in entry 1.—
(1) in clause (a), for the figures “5,000” the figures “7,500” shall be
substituted;
72) in clause (b), for the figures “5,000” the figures “7,500” shall be
substituted.
CHAPTER V
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA TAX ON LUXURIES AcT, 1987.

8. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Tax on Luxuries Act, 1987

XIilgg(;f (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Luxury Tax Act”),—

(1) in clause (b-1A), after the words and figures “Tourism Projects,
2000” the words and figures “or the Tourism Policy- 2006” shall be added;
(2) in clause (d-1), after the words and figures “Tourism Projects,
2000” the words and figures “or the Tourism Policy-2006” shall be added.

9. In section 3 of the Luxury Tax Act, in sub-section (2),—

{1) in clause (a), for the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees” the
words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted,;

(2) in clause (b},—

i) for the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees” the words
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “twelve hundred rupees” the words “one
thousand five hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(3) in clause (c¢), for the words “twelve hundred rupees” the words

“one thousand five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

10. In section 22A of the Luxury Tax Act, in sub-section (I),—

(1) for the words, brackets and figures “sub-entry (2) or, as the case
may be, sub-entry (3} of entry 7 of the Schedule appended to the
notification issued” the words “any of the entries of the Schedule
appended to the notification issued, from time to time,” shall be
substituted,

T A3~k —R

Amendment
of section
27A of Mah.
XVIof1975.

Amendment of
SCHEDULE1
of Mah. XVI

of 1975.

Amendmerit
of section 2
of Mah. XLI
of 1987.

Amendment
of section 3§
of Mah. XLI
of 1987.

Amendmént
of sectiory

22A of Mah.
XLI of 1987.

e, &

SRR went st Ll o,
iR I R SN s WA PR e mitim i e R

B S B Yo

e e


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark g
L 1 HERTE, IMHA AATT JATARIT 91T 308, 7 RE, J0%%/

(2) after the word and figures “Act, 2004,” the words and figures “or, as
the case may be, the Tourism Policy- 2006,” shall be inserted;

(3) in the marginal note, after the words “Tourism Projects” the words
“and Tourism Policy” shall be added.”.

Insertion of 11. After section 22A of the Luxury Tax Act, the following section shall
section 22B 1,6 inserted, namely :—

in Mah. XLI

of 1987.
Incentives to “22B. (1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in
Eligible Lgn}t Tourism Policy- 2006, the Certificate of Entitlement, in respect of
Con;?n;;;.‘;’; Tourism Policy- 20086, shall be granted only to the Eligible Unit, situated
under in areas specified in Zone ‘B’ or, as the case may be, Zone ‘C’ as shown in
Tourism Annexure ‘B’ to the said Policy, to which the Eligibility Certificate has
Policy-2006. been issued after the commencement of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy,

Amendment and Validation) Act, 2014 :

Provided that, Certificate of Entitlement to the Expansion Unit
under the Tourism Policy- 2006 shall be grantéed only if there is an
increase in capacity of the existing unit.

(2) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in Tourism
Policy-2006, any Eligible Unit, to whom the Eligibility Certificate and
Certificate of Entitlement has been granted, for expansion of existing
unit, shall be entitled to draw the benefits under the Act, in any year,
only on that part of its turnover of receipts as may be arrived at, by
applying the provisions of sub-section (3).

(3) In case where the Eligible Unit has,—

(a) maintained separate accounts of receipts and able to
identify the receipts pertaining to the increased capacity, then the
portion of the turnover of receipts eligible for benefits will be
decided solely on the basis of such identification;

(b) not maintained separate accounts of receipts and not able
to identify the receipts in relation to increase in the capacity, then
such benefits shall be calculated after applying the formula as
under :—

Eligible turnover of receipts = Turnover of ‘recelpts x mcr(?ase in capacity
Total capacity after such increase

Explanation.— For the purpose of this section, the expression
“increase in capacity”shall have the same meaning as specified in the
Tourism Policy—20086.”.

CHAPTER VI
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED Tax Acr, 2002,

Amendment 12. In section 3 of’the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002
ofo&f}ftﬁlﬂ (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”), in

‘9005, Sub-section (4), in clause (b), for the figures “5,00,000” the figures “10,00,000”

shall be substituted.

Amendment 13. In section 10 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
:gﬁe:ﬁl_o&log (1) in sub-section (2), clause (b) shall be deleted;

2005. (2) in sub-section (6), the words “Senior Deputy Commissioners,” shall

be deleted.

mm Wondershare

PDFelement

Mah.
XXVII
0f2014.

Mah.
X of
2005.


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

S ra K

AT

re e

TR
R R

TR IETRTIN I WART R D e L e « e v «qwﬂ

mm Wondershare
N  PDFelement

T I TS FETYRYT 90T 373, , oY
HERT ST R RR Remove Watermark

14. In section 16 of the Value Added Tax Act, in _
(1) in clause (b), after the words and figure “of section 3,” the word gf ls\;ﬁo%{l :
“or” shall be added,; of 2005, '
{2) after clause (b) so amended, the following clause shall be added,
namely :—

“(c) the turnover of sales of a registered dealer, other than an
importer, has during the year 2013-14, not exceeded the limit,
specified in sub- section (4) of section 3,”;
t3) after the words “circumstances of the case.”, the following shall

be inserted, namely :—

“In the case covered by clause (c), the dealer may apply in the
prescribed form for cancellation of his registration to the
Commissioner on or before the 30th September 2014 and thereupon
the Commissioner may, after such inquiry as he deems fit, cancel
the registration with effect from the 1st October 2014.”.

15. In section 20 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (6), for the Amendment . !
words “five thousand” the words “two thousand if the return is filed within a of section 20 . -
period of thirty days from the expiry of the due date prescribed for filing of of Mah,IX 2
such return and an amount of rupees five thousand, in any other case” shall 0f 2005,
be substituted.

16. In section 23 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

PRUERLRY S R

LE
oy,
L E
ot
cE

Amendment
of section 23 !

(1) sub-section (9) shall be deleted; of Mah. IX of
(2) to sub-section (I0), the following proviso shall be added, 2005
namely :(—

“Provided that, in respect of the period commencing on or after
the 1st April 2011, in case a dealer is required under the rules, to
file more than one return in different forms prescribed, then such
dealer may be assessed separately for each form of return for the
said period.”;

(3) in sub-section (11),—

(@) after the words “order in writing” the words “within three
months from the end of the month in which such application is made”
shall be inserted;

(b) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided further that, if no order is passed within the
aforesaid period of three months, then the assessment order
shall be deemed to be cancelled.”;

(4) in sub-section (72), after the words “cancellation order” the
words, brackets and figures “ or, as the case may be, from the date on
which the assessment order is deemed to have been cancelled under the
second proviso to sub-section (11)” shall be added.

A

17. In section 26 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section {(6},— Amendment, : 2
e

U e TAS

T
BRSO

(1) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be 0215\/?;%"&26{
inserted, namely :— ‘ ;005 . Xof®

“Provided that, in case of an appeal filed on or after the 1st
July 2014 against any order, in which claim against declaration or
certificate, has been disallowed on the grounds of non-production
of such declarations or, as the case may be, certificates then,—
(a) where such appeal is filed after two years from the
end of the year to which such claim relates, then the stay shall
not be granted unless the appellant makes 100 per cent.
payment of tax, in respect of such claim,

T AS-198—A

e T



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Amendment
of section 29
of Mah. IX
of 2005.

Amendment

HERTEE, ITEA AT A[TIARYT VI A6, 7 &, 0%/ IMEREnR0TE Watermark .-

(b) where such appeal is filed before the expiry of two
years from the end of the year to which such claim relates, the
stay, if any, shall stand vacated, if the dealer fails to produce
the required declaration before the expiry of the said period of
two years.

Explanation.— For the purpose of computing payment in
the appeal, mentioned in the above clauses, the amount of part
payment made earlier, if any, shall be included.”;

(2} in the existing proviso, for the words “Provided that” the words
“Provided further that” shall be substituted.

18. In section 29 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (3), for the words “equal to” the words “not
exceeding the amount of tax due but not less than twenty five per cent.
of ” shall be substituted;

(2) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :(—
“(7A) In case of a dealer, who has filed late return on or after
the 1st August 2012, and has also paid the late fee, under sub-section
(6) of section 20, the penalty in respect of such return, if any, imposed
under sub-section (8) of this section, as it existed, shall not be
recovered.”;
(3) after sub-section (11), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(11A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (11),
penalty under this section may be imposed while passing an order
under this Act.”;

(4) sub-section (12) shall be deleted.
19. In section 30 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4), the

of section 30 following shall be added at the end, namely :—

of Mah. IX
of 2005.

Amendment
of section
31A of Mah.
IX of 2005.

“Provided that, interest under this sub-section shall not be payable
on account of the additional tax liability arising due to non-production
of declarations or, as the case may be, certificates:

Provided further that, if the amount of tax paid as per revised return
is less than ten per cent. of the aggregate amount of tax paid as per the
original returns, in respect of the corresponding period, then no interest
under this sub-section shall be payable.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this sub-section the expressions,—

(i) “tax paid as per original returns” shall be deemed to include the
amount of tax paid, as per the revised returns, filed before the
commencement of proceedings specified in clause (e¢) or before the
receipt of intimation specified in clause (b) of sub-section (4) ;

(i) “tax paid” shall mean the amount of tax paid by such person or
dealer, after the adjustment of set-off.”.

20. In section 31A of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), after clause (b), the following clause shall be
added, namely :— )

“(c) who awards quarrying lease or quarrying permit in respect
of minor minerals to a dealer, within their jurisdiction to collect an
amount at the time of such award or, as the case may be, auction, at
such rate as provided in sub-section (2) towards the liability of sales
tax to be incurred on sale of such minor minerals.”;

Wondershare
PDFelement


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

TERTE JORA AT FWARTT U A1, T &, 0¥/

(2) in sub-section (2), for the brackets, letters and word
the brackets, letters and word * (a), (#) and (¢)” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the brackets, word and letters “(a) and (b)”
the brackets, letters and word “ (a), (b) and (¢)” shall be substituted

21. Insection 51 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (3), in clause
ta), in sub-clause (iii), for the words and figures “Package Scheme of
Incentives-2001 or, as the case may be, Package Scheme of Incentives-2007”
the words and figures “Package Scheme of Incentives-2001, Package Scheme
of Incentives-2007 or, as the case may be, Package Scheme of Incentives-
2013” shall be substituted.

22. In section 61 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
(1) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

“a) if the,—

(i) dggregate of his turnover of sales and the value of
goods transferred to any other place of his business or of
his agent or principal, situated outside the State, not by
reason of sale, or

(ii) turnover of purchases,
exceeds rupees one crore in any year;”;
(ii) clause (b) shall be deleted;
(2) in sub-section (2), the proviso shall be deleted.

23. In section 63 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (7), for the
words “Commissioner may” the words “Commissioner shall” shall be
substituted,

24. In section 88 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in clause (a-1), for the words and figures “Package Scheme of
Incentives-2001 or, as the case may be, Package Scheme of Incentives-
2007” the words and figures.“Package Scheme of Incentives-2001, Package
Scheme of Incentives-2007 or, as the case may be, Package Scheme of
Incentives-2013” shall be substituted;

(2) in clause (e), for the words and figures “the Package Scheme of
Incentives-2001 or, as the case may be, Package Scheme of Incentives-
2007” the words and figures “the Package Scheme of Incentives-2001,
Package Scheme of Incentives-2007 or, as the case may be, Package
Scheme of Incentives-2013” shall be substituted.

25. In section 89 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (4), for the
words and figures “Package Scheme of Incentives-2001 or, as the case may
be, Package Scheme of Incentives-2007 ” the words and figures “ Package
Scheme of Incentives-2001, Package Scheme of Incentives-2007 or, as the case
may be, Package Scheme of Incentives- 2013” shall be substituted.

26. In SCHEDULE A appended to the Value Added Tax Act, after entry
26, the following entry shall be inserted, namely :—

“26A Copyrights, for distribution and exhibition of Nil”,
cinematographic films in theatres and cinema
halls, sold ‘during the period commencing on the
1st April 2005 and ending on the 30th April 2011.

Wondershare
PDFelement

Amendment-
of section 51
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment
of section 6%
of Mah. IX
of 2005

Amendment
of section 43
of Mah IX'of
2005,

Amendment
of section B8
of Mah IX;%
of 2005.

Amendmgnt
of sectioni89
of Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment

of 2005.



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

<

Amendment

of
SCHEDULE

C of Mah. IX
of 2005.

Validation
and savings.

IR, TTEHF qHATH FAHTUROT YT ATS; 5[ &, R0%%/ .

Remove Watermark g

27. In SCHEDULE C of the Value Added Tax
following entries shall be inserted, namely :—

“65A Tool, alloy and special steels of any of the 4%
categories, specified in clause (x) to clause (xv)
of entry 55 of this Schedule, sold during the
period commencing on the 1st ‘April 2005 and
ending on the 30th April 2011.

55B Tool, alloy and special steels of any of the 5%,
categories, specified in clause (x) to clause (xv)
of entry 55 of this Schedule, sold on or after the
1st May 2011.

CHAPTER VII
VALIDATION AND SAVINGS.

28. (I) Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree
or order of any Court or Tribunal to the contrary, any assessment, review,
levy or collection of tax in respect of sales or purchases effected by any dealer
or person, or any action taken or thing done in relation to such assessment,
review, levy or collection of tax by any dealer or person under the provisions
of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 (hereinafter in this section
referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”), before the commencement of the
Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation) Act, 2014
(hereinafter, in this section, referred to as “the Amendment Act”), shall be
deemed to be valid and effective as if such assessment, review, levy or
collection or action or thing had been duly made, taken or done under the
Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, and accordingly,—

(a) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by the State
Government or by any officer of the State Government or by any other
authority in connection with the assessment, review, levy or collection
of any such tax, shall, for all purposes, be deemed to be, and to have
always been done or taken in accordance with the law;

(b) no suit, appeal, application or other proceedings shall lie or be
maintained or continued in any Court or before any Tribunal, officer or
other authority, for the refund of any tax so paid; and

(c) no Court, Tribunal, officer or other authority shall enforce any
decree or order directing the refund. of any such tax.

(2) For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that nothing in sub-
section (I) shall be construed as preventing a person,—

(a) from questioning in accordance with the provisions of the Value
Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, any assessment,
review, levy or collection of tax referred to in sub-section (1), or

(b) from claiming refund of any tax paid by him in excess of the
amount due from him by way of tax under the Value Added Tax Act, as
amended by the Amendment Act.

Wondershare
PDFelement



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare
Remove Watermark g PDFelement

WERTY, THEA TATR SHAYRYT WIT 316, S| 3%, 0%%/

(3) Nothing in the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment ) %
Act, shall render any person liable to be convicted of any offence in respect of
anything done or omitted to be done by him, before the commencement of the
Amendment Act, if such act or omission was not an offence under the Value
Added Tax Act, but for the amendments made by the Amendment Act; nor
shall any person in respect of such act or omission be subject to a penalty
have greater than that which could have been imposed on him under the law
in force immediately before the commencement of the Amendment Act.

ON},BEHPLF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION. PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI], PRINTED
A’%OVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBALI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare
PDFelement

Remove Watermark g

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

HelTSE MHA 19 A
STAEIRUT {7 3ATS

aw g, IFF R AR, T 2¢, R0%4/T ¢, TEH 2R39 [ g2 &, fFma @ w0 Re.00

SATIART HHF ¥ ¥

T e USRI

werTe faurrizesr sfufem g TcauEt et Foe Ry T theret faftam enfur
fafer @ = faurmegs et fadad (FuSt oaTe).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation) Act, 2015
(Mah. Act No. XVII of 2015), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

M. A. SAYEED,
Principal Secretary and R. L. A. to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XVII OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 18th April 2015).

An Act further to amend certain tax laws in operation in the
State of Maharashtra.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend certain tax laws in operation in
the State of Maharashtra, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is hereby
enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY
1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment Short title
and Validation) Act, 2015. and
commencement.
®

AT 3MS—¥ ¥ —


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Amendment of
section 12B of
Mah. IX of

in clause (e), for the word and figures “year 2013-14” the words and figures

mm Wondershare
Remove Watermark g PDFelement

HERTEZ MEA AU A|TLRUT HRT 1S, THA ¢, 0%/

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(a) sections 2 to 5, sub-section (1) of section 6 and sections 7 to 11 shall
come into force with effect from the 1st April 2015;

(b) sub-section (2) of section 6 shall come into force with effect from the
1st May 2015.

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA PURCHASE TAX ON SUGARCANE AcT, 1962.

2. In section 12B of the Maharashtra Purchase Tax on Sugarcane Act, 1962, 1\’;31151)-62154
(o) .

1962. “yvears 2013-14 and 2014-15” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
SCHEDULE 1
of Mah. XVI of

Trades, Callings and Employments Act, 1975, in entry 1, for clause (), the following

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA STATE Tax oN PROFESSIONS, TRADES, CALLINGS

AND EmpPLOYMENTS AcT, 1975.

3. In SCHEDULE I appended to the Maharashtra State Tax on Professions, Mah.XVI
of 1975.

1975. clause shall be substituted, namely :—

Amendment of

“(b) (i) in case of a male, exceed Rs. 7,500 . . 175 per month.
but do not exceed Rs. 10,000 ;

(it) in case of a female, do not exceed .. Nil.”.
Rs. 10,000 ;

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA TAX oN THE ENTRY oF GOODS INTO
LocaL Areas Act, 2002.

4. In the SCHEDULE appended to the Maharashtra Tax on the Entry of Mah. IV

SCHSIDELI% Og Goods into Local Areas Act, 2002, after entry 16, the following entry shall be added, ©°f 2003-
B '2003_ namely :—
“17. Goods covered by clauses (iv) and (v) of entry . . 5%.”.
55 of Schedule C, appended to the Maharashtra 1\’1{321:)-051)(
[0) .

Amendment of

Value Added Tax Act, 2002.

CHAPTER V
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED Tax Act, 2002.

5. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002 (hereinafter, Mah. IX

section 2 of i this Chapter, referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”),— of 2005.

Mah. IX of
2005.

(1) in clause (20), after Explanation I, the following Explanation shall be

inserted, namely :(—

“ Explanation—IA.—Purchase price shall not include the amount of service

tax levied or leviable under the Finance Act, 1994 and collected separately by 32 of 1994.
the seller.”;

(2) in clause (25), after Explanation I, the following Explanation shall be

inserted, namely :(—

“Explanation—IA.—Sale price shall not include the amount of service tax

levied or leviable under the Finance Act, 1994 and collected separately from the 32 of 1994.
purchaser.”.


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark

HERTE IMHF AU SFETEARUT HAT 316, T 8¢, 0%/

6. In section 20 of the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in sub-section (4), in the proviso, for the words “the aforesaid clauses”
the words, brackets and letters “clause (a) or, as the case may be, clause (b),”
shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (6), for the words “two thousand” the words “one thousand”
shall be substituted.

7. In section 23 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
(1) in sub-section (5),—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “During the course of any proceedings under
this Act, if the prescribed authority is satisfied” the words “Where the prescribed
authority has reason to believe” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (d), after the proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided further that, in case a notice is issued under this sub-section
on or after the 1st April 2015, no order of assessment under this sub-section
shall be made after the expiry of six years from the end of the year, containing
the transaction or, as the case may be, claim.”;

(2) in sub-section (11), for the brackets, figures and word “(3) or (4)” in both
the places where they occur, the brackets, figures and words “(3), (4) or, as the case
may be, (5)” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (12), for the brackets, figures and word “(3) or (4)” the
brackets, figures and words “(3), (4) or, as the case may be, (5)” shall be substituted.

8. For section 28 of the Value Added Tax Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“28. Where any Court or Tribunal or any Appellate authority or any other
authority passes an order in appeal or review which has the effect that,—

(i) any tax assessed under this Act or any other Act should have been assessed
under the provisions of an Act other than that under which it was assessed, or

(it) any claim allowed or disallowed modifies the tax liability under this Act or
any other Act,

then in consequence of such order, such turnover or part thereof may be
assessed or, as the case may be, tax liability may be determined, under this Act in
accordance with the allowance or disallowance of such claim and may be subjected
to tax at any time within five years from the date of such order :

Provided that, where any assessment has already been made, the assessment
shall be modified after giving the dealer a reasonable opportunity of being heard,
notwithstanding that any provision regarding limitation applies to such assessment
period.”.

9. In section 30 of the Value Added Tax Act, in sub-section (2), after the
proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided further that, in case a dealer files an annual revised return, as
provided under clause (b) or, as the case may be, clause (c¢) of sub-section (4) of
section 20, then the interest shall be payable on the excess amount of tax, as per
such annual revised return, from the dates mentioned in column (2) of the Table,
till the date of payment of such excess amount of tax.

AT SAB-¥¥—R

Wondershare
PDFelement

Amendment of
section 20 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Amendment of
section 23 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Substitution of
section 28 of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Modification of
tax liability.

Amendment of
section 30 of
Mah. IX of 2005.



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Remove Watermark .-

¥ TERTE JMEA IS FATEIRUT WA 3AS, THA ¢, 0%/
TABLE
Registration status in the year for Interest to be
which annual revised return is filed computed from

(1) (2)

(a) Dealer, holding certificate of registration for 1st October of the year, to
whole year. which the annual revised
return relates.

(b) Certificate of registration granted, effective 1st October of the year, to
from any date up to the 30th September of which the annual revised
the year to which revised return relates. return relates.

(c) Certificate of registration cancelled, effective 1st October of the year, to
on any date after the 30th September of the which the annual revised
year to which revised return relates. return relates.

(d) Certificate of registration granted, effective effective date of
from any date after the 30th September of registration.
the year to which revised return relates.

(e) Certificate of registration cancelled, effective effective date of
on any date prior to the 30th September of cancellation
the year to which revised return relates. of registration.”.

Amendmezi 0£ 10. In section 44 of the Value Added Tax Act, after sub-section (4), the
section 0 . . . .
Mah. IX of following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—
2005. “(4A) For the purposes of this Act, in case of amalgamation, merger or, as

the case may be, demerger, the transfer of business shall be deemed to have
taken effect either from,

(i) the date of the order of the High Court, the Tribunal or the Central
Government, or

(ii) the date on which the Registrar of Companies notifies the
amalgamation, merger or as the case may be, demerger,

as opted by the company.”.

Amendment of 11. In section 47 of the Value Added Tax Act,—
section 47 of
Mah. g)(ogf (1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the word “Court” the words “ Court, Tribunal ” shall be substituted,;

(b) for the words “ending on the date of the order,” the words “ending on
the date, as opted by the company, to be the date of the order or the date on
which the Registrar of Companies notifies the amalgamation,” shall be
substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “the date of the said order” in both the
places where they occur, the words “such date, as opted by the company under
sub-section (4A) of section 44” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (2A),—

(a) in clause (a),—

(@) for the word, “Court” the words “ Court, Tribunal ” shall be
substituted,;

(ii) for the words “order to the date of the order” the words “order
to the date, as opted by the company, to be the date of the order or the
date on which the Registrar of Companies notifies the demerger” shall be
substituted ;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “ the date of the said order” wherever they
occur, the words “such date, as opted by the company under sub-section (4A) of
section 44” shall be substituted.

Wondershare
PDFelement



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

Mah. IX
of 2005.

Mah. IX
of 2005.

Mabh.
XVII of
2015.

Remove Watermark
HERTE IEA IS FEERT HET A6, THA ¢, R0%4/

12. In Schedule C appended to the Value Added Tax Act,—

(1) in entry 4, the following Explanation shall be added and shall be deemed
to have been added with effect from the 1st April 2005, namely:—

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this entry, as it stood from time to time,
the “sewing thread” shall include embroidery thread.”;

(2) in entry 91, the following Explanation shall be added and shall be deemed
to have been added with effect from the 1st April 2005, namely :(—

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this entry, as it stood from time to time,
“spices” shall include spices in all forms, varieties and mixtures of any of the
spices.”.

13. In the Government Notification, Finance Department, No. VAT-1505/
CR-234/Taxation-1, dated the 1st September 2005, issued under entry 54 of Schedule
C of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002, in the Schedule appended to the
said notification, in entry 2, in column (5), for the words “Desi loni” the words “Desi
loni, white butter” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from the 15t September 2005.

CHAPTER VI

VALIDATION AND SAVINGS

14. (I) Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree or
order of any Court or Tribunal to the contrary, any assessment, review, levy or
collection of tax in respect of sales or purchases effected by any dealer or person,
or any action taken or thing done in relation to such assessment, review, levy or
collection under the provisions of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act, 2002
(hereinafter, in this section, referred to as “the Value Added Tax Act”), before the
commencement of the Maharashtra Tax Laws (Levy, Amendment and Validation)
Act, 2015 (hereinafter, in this section, referred to as “the Amendment Act”), shall
be deemed to be valid and effective as if such assessment, review, levy or collection
or action or thing had been duly made, taken or done under the Value Added Tax
Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, and accordingly,—

(a) all acts, proceedings or things done or taken by the State Government
or by any officer of the State Government or by any other authority in connection
with the assessment, review, levy or collection of any such tax, shall, for all
purposes, be deemed to be, and to have always been done or taken in accordance
with the law;

(b) no suit, appeal, application or other proceedings shall lie or be maintained
or continued in any Court or before any Tribunal, officer or other authority, for
the refund of any tax so paid; and

(¢) no Court, Tribunal, officer or other authority shall enforce any decree
or order directing the refund of any such tax.

(2) For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that nothing in sub-section
(1) shall be construed as preventing a person,—

(a) from questioning in accordance with the provisions of the Value Added
Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment Act, any assessment, review, levy or
collection of tax referred to in sub-section (1), or

(b) from claiming refund of any tax paid by him in excess of the amount
due from him by way of tax under the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the
Amendment Act.

mm Wondershare
H  PDFelement

Amendment to
Schedule C of
Mah. IX of

2005.

Amendment
to notification
issued under
entry 54 of
Schedule C of
Mah. IX of
2005.

Validation and
savings.



http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db

mm Wondershare
Remove Watermark g PDFelement

& HERTEZ MEA AU A|TLRUT HRT 1S, THA ¢, 0%/

(3) Nothing in the Value Added Tax Act, as amended by the Amendment Act,
shall render any person liable to be convicted of any offence in respect of anything
done or omitted to be done by him, before the commencement of the Amendment
Act, if such act or omission was not an offence under the Value Added Tax Act, but
for the amendments made by the Amendment Act; nor shall any person in respect
of such Act or omission be subject to a penalty greater than that which could have
been imposed on him under the law in force immediately before the commencement
of the Amendment Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.


http://cbs.wondershare.com/go.php?pid=5261&m=db



